OA\MCGWMCG17C67.xml [file 1 of 5] S.L.C.

AMENDMENT NO. Calendar No.

Purpose: To provide a perfecting amendment.
IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES—115th Cong., 1st Sess.

H.R.1

To provide for reconciliation pursuant to titles II and V
of the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal
year 2018.

Referred to the Committee on and
ordered to be printed

Ordered to lie on the table and to be printed

AMENDMENT intended to be proposed by
to the amendment (No. )

proposed by

Viz:

1 Strike all after the first word and insert the following:



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O© 00 NN N A WD

e e e O S Sy SO VU G U
O 00 N N N b WD = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

2
TITLE 1
SEC. 11000. SHORT TITLE, ETC.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This title may be cited as the
“Tax Cuts and Jobs Act”.

(b) AMENDMENT OF 1986 CODE.—Except as other-
wise expressly provided, whenever in this title an amend-
ment, or repeal is expressed in terms of an amendment
to, or repeal of, a section or other provision, the reference
shall be considered to be made to a section or other provi-
sion of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986.

Subtitle A—Individual Tax Reform
PART I—TAX RATE REFORM

SEC. 11001. MODIFICATION OF RATES.

(a) IN GENXERAL.—Section 1 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:
“(J) MODIFICATIONS FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018

THROUGH 2025.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a taxable
year beginning after December 31, 2017, and before
January 1, 2026—
““(A) subsection (i) shall not apply, and
“(B) this section (other than subsection

(1)) shall be applied as provided in paragraphs

(2) through (7).

“(2) RATE TABLES.



OANOTTNOTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

W

10

3
“(A) MARRIED INDIVIDUALS FILING JOINT
RETURNS AND SURVIVING SPOUSES.—The fol-
lowing table shall be applied in lieu of the table

contained in subsection (a):

“If taxable income is: The tax is:

Not over $19,050 .....ccooovrvieeieieiieiene, 10% of taxable income.

Over $19,050 but not over $77,400 .......... $1,905, plus 12% of the excess over
$19,050.

Over $77,400 but not over $140,000 ........ $8,907, plus 22% of the excess over
$77,400.

Over $140,000 but. not over $320,000 ...... $22,679, plus 24% of the excess
over $140,000.

Over $320,000 but not over $400,000 ...... $65,879, plus 32% of the excess

over $320,000.

Over $400,000 but not over $1,000,000 ... $91,479, plus 35% of the excess
over $400,000.

Over $1,000,000 ....ocoovvvriiiininiieenee $301,479, plus 38.5% of the excess
over $1,000,000.

“(B) HEADS OF HOUSEHOLDS.—The fol-
lowing table shall be applied in lieu of the table

contained in subsection (b):

“If taxable income is: The tax is:

Not over $13,600 ....ccooceevivriieieeeieeeeee, 10% of taxable income,

Over $13,600 but not over $51,800 .......... $1,360, plus 12% of the excess over
$13,600.

Over $51,800 but not over $70,000 .......... $5,944, plus 22% of the excess over
$51,800.

Over $70,000 but not over $160,000 ........ $9,948, plus 24% of the excess over
$70,000.

Over $160,000 but not over $200,000 ...... $31,548, plus 32% of the excess
over $160,000.

Over $200,000 but not over $500,000 ...... $44,348, plus 35% of the excess
over $200,000.

Over $500,000 ...........ooooviiiieee $149,348, plus 38.5% of the excess

over $500,000.

“(C) UNMARRIED INDIVIDUALS OTHER
THAN SURVIVING SPOUSES AND HEADS OF

HOUSEHOLDS.—The following table shall be ap-



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

2

AN W B~ W

4
plied in licu of the table contained in subsection

(¢):

“If taxable income is: The tax is:

Not over $9,525 ..o, 10% of taxable income.

Over $9,525 but not over $38,700 ............ $952.50, plus 12% of the excess
over $9,525.

Over $38,700 but not over $70,000 .......... $4,453.50, plus 22% of the excess
over $38,700.

Over $70,000 but not over $160,000 ........ $11,339.50, plus 24% of the excess
over $70,000.

Over $160,000 but not over $200,000 ...... $32,939.50, plus 32% of the excess
over $160,000.

Over $200,000 but not over $500,000 ...... $45,739.50, plus 35% of the excess
over $200,000.

Over $500,000 .....ccoovvieiiiiiccieeeceeeeen, $150,739.50, plus 38.5% of the ex-

cess over $500,000.

‘(D) MARRIED INDIVIDUALS FILING SEPA-

RATE RETURNS.—The following table shall be
applied in licu of the table contained in sub-

section (d):

“If taxable income is: The tax is:

Not over $9,525 ...ooviiiiiiiiice 10% of taxable income,

Over $9,525 but not over $38,700 ............ $952.50, plus 12% of the excess
over $9,525.

Over $38,700 but not over $70,000 .......... $4,453.50, plus 22% of the excess
over $38,700.

Over $70,000 but not over $160,000 ........ $11,339.50, plus 24% of the excess
over $70,000.

Over $160,000 but not over $200,000 ...... $32,939.50, plus 32% of the excess
over $160,000.

Over $200,000 but not over $500,000 ...... $45,739.50, plus 35% of the excess
over $200,000.

Over $500,000 .....ooovveiiiiiiiiiiiie e, $150,739.50, plus 38.5% of the ex-

cess over $500,000.

“(E) ESTATES AND TRUSTS.—The fol-
lowing table shall be applied in lieu of the table

contained in subsection (e):




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N U bW N =

[N I e e e T e YO Ny e W G G S
S O 00 N N N R WD = O

5
“If taxable income is: The tax is:
Not over $2,550 ......cccooovieviiiieiiee 10% of taxable income.
Over $2,550 but not over $9,150 ............. $255, plus 24% of the excess over
$2,550.
Over $9,150 but not over $12,500 ............ $1,839, plus 35% of the excess over
$9,150.
Over $12500 ...cccoooveviirieiiieie e $3,011.50, plus 38.5% of the ex-

cess over $12 500,

“(F) REFERENCES TO RATE TABLES.

Any reference in this title to a rate of tax under
subsection (¢) shall be treated as a reference to
the corresponding rate bracket under subpara-
graph (C) of this paragraph, except that the
reference in section 3402(q)(1) to the third low-
est rate of tax applicable under subsection (¢)
shall be treated as a reference to the fourth
lowest rate of tax under subparagraph (C).

“(3) ADJUSTMENTS.

“(A) NO ADJUSTMENT IN 2018.—The ta-
bles contained in paragraph (2) shall apply
without adjustment for taxable years beginning

after December 31, 2017, and before January

1, 2019.

“(B) SUBSEQUENT YEARS.—For taxable
years beginning after December 31, 2018, the
Secretary shall preseribe tables which shall
apply in lieu of the tables contained in para-

graph (2) in the same manner as under para-



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N O W A~ W N -

—_
o

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

6
graphs (1) and (2) of subscetion (f), exeept that
in prescribing such tables—

“(1) subsection (f)(3) shall be applied
by substituting ‘calendar yecar 2017 for
‘calendar year 2016’ in subparagraph
(A)(11) thereof,

“(i1) subsection (£)(7)(B) shall apply
to any unmarried individual other than a
surviving spouse or head of household, and

“(iii) subsection (f)(8) shall not apply.

“(4) SPECIAL RULES FOR CERTAIN CHILDREN

WITH UNEARNED INCOME.

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a child

to whom subscction (g) applies for the taxable

year, the rules of subparagraphs (B) and (C)

shall apply in licu of the rule under subscetion
(2)(1).

“(B) MODIFICATIONS TO APPLICABLE
RATE BRACKETS.—In determining the amount
of tax imposed by this section for the taxable
vear on a child deseribed in subparagraph (A),
the income tax table otherwise applicable under
this subsection to the child shall be applied with

the following modifications:



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N O W bW =

NN NN N N = e e e e e ek e e
hn A W D = O O 00NN N R W N = O

7

“(1)  24-PERCENT BRACKET.—The
maximum taxable income which is taxed at
a rate below 24 percent shall not be more
than the carned taxable income of such
child.

“(i1)  35-PERCENT BRACKET.—The
maximum taxable income which is taxed at
a rate below 35 percent shall not be more
than the sum of—

“(I) the earned taxable income of
such child, plus

“(II) the minimum taxable in-
come for the 35-percent bracket in the
table under paragraph (2)(E) (as ad-
justed under paragraph (3)) for the
taxable year.

“(i1) 38.5-PERCENT BRACKET.—The
maximum taxable income which is taxed at
a ratc below 38.5 percent shall not be
more than the sum of—

“(I) the earned taxable income of
such child, plus

“(II) the minimum taxable in-
come for the 38.5-percent bracket in

the table under paragraph (2)(E) (as




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

C o0 N AN B W -

NN N NN N e e e e s e e e e
L W NN = O 0O 0NN W RWNDN= O

8

adjusted under paragraph (3)) for the
taxable year.

“(C) COORDINATION WITH CAPITAL GAINS
RATES.—For purposes of applying scction 1(h)
(after the modifications under paragraph (5))—

“(1) the maximum zero rate amount
shall not be more than the sum of—
“(I) the earned taxable income of
such child, plus
“(II) the amount in effect under
paragraph (5)(B)(1)(IV) for the tax-
able year, and
“(i1) the maximum 15-percent rate
amount shall not be more than the sum
of—
“(I) the earned taxable income of
such child, plus
“(IT) the amount in effect under
paragraph (5)(B)(11)(IV) for the tax-
able year.

“(D) EARNED TAXABLE INCOME.—For
purposes of this paragraph, the term ‘earned
taxable income’ means, with respect to any
child for any taxable year, the taxable income

of such child reduced (but not below zero) by



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N N Lt B W N -

BN N N NN = e e e e e e e e e
A W = O 0O 0NN N N Bl WND= O

9
the net uncarned income (as defined in sub-
section (g)(4)) of such child.

“(5) APPLICATION OF CURRENT INCOME TAX

BRACKETS TO CAPITAL GAINS BRACKETS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 1(h)(1) shall

be applied
“(i) by substituting ‘below the max-
imum zero rate amount’ for ‘which would

(without regard to this paragraph) be

taxed at a rate below 25 percent’ in sub-

paragraph (B)(1), and

“(i1) by substituting ‘below the max-
imum 15-pereent rate amount’ for ‘which
would (without regard to this paragraph)
be taxed at a rate below 39.6 percent’ in

subparagraph (C)(ii)(I).

“(B) MAXIMUM AMOUNTS DEFINED.—For
purposes of applying section 1(h) with the
modifications described in subparagraph (A)—

“(1) MAXIMUM ZERO RATE

AMOUNT.—The  maximum  zero  rate

amount shall be—

“(I) in the case of a joint return

or surviving spouse, $77,200,




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

10

O o0 N N W B W

[\ TN NG TR N T NG N NG TR N T S GG G RS VR S Y GG G
whn W N = O O 00 N O W A WND= O

“(IT) in the case of an individual
who 1s a head of household (as de-
fined in section 2(b)), $51,700,

“(ITI) in the case of any other in-
dividual (other than an estate or
trust), an amount cqual to 2 of the
amount in effect for the taxable year
under subelause (I), and

“(IV) in the case of an cstate or
trust, $2,600.

“(m) MAXIMUM 15-PERCENT RATE

AMOUNT.—The maximum 15-percent rate

amount shall be—

“(I) in the case of a joint return
or surviving spouse, $479,000 (V%
such amount in the case of a married
individual filing a separate return),

“(II) 1n the case of an ndividual
who 1s the head of a houschold (as de-
fined in section 2(b)), $452,400,

“(IIT) in the case of any other in-
dividual (other than an estate or
trust), $425,800, and

“(IV) in the case of an estate or

trust, $12,700.



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

1

O 00 NN A B W

| T N T O T N T N N e e S g O ey S Sy
hn A W N = O O 00 3 O W A WND-= O

%
&
o

11
“(C) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In the

case of any taxable year beginning after 2018,

each of the dollar amounts in clauses (i) and

(1) of subparagraph (I3) shall be increased by

an amount equal to—

“(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by

“(i1) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
termined under subsection (f)(3) for the
calendar year in which the taxable year be-
gins, determined by substituting ‘calendar
year 2017 for ‘calendar year 2016’ in sub-
paragraph (A)(i1) thereof.

“(6) SECTION 15 NOT TO APPLY.—Section 15
shall not apply to any change in a rate of tax by rea-
son of this subsection.”.

(B) DUE DILIGENCE TAX PREPARER REQUIREMENT
WitH RESPECT TO HEAD OF HOUSEHOLD FILING STA-
TUS.—Subsection (g) of section 6695 is amended to read
as follows:

“(g) FAILURE TO BE DILIGENT IN DETERMINING

ELIGIBILITY FOR CERTAIN TAX BENEFITS.—Any person
who is a tax return preparer with respect to any return
or claim for refund who fails to comply with due diligence
requirements imposed by the Secretary by regulations with

respect to determining—



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

[um—

O 00 NN N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

12
“(1) eligibility to file as a head of houschold (as
defined in section 2(b)) on the return, or
“(2) eligibility for, or the amount of, the credit

allowable by scction 24, 25A(a)(1), or 32,
shall pay a penalty of $500 for each such failure.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11002. INFLATION ADJUSTMENTS BASED ON CHAINED
CPL

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsecction (f) of section 1 is
amended by striking paragraph (3) and by inserting after
paragraph (2) the following new paragraph:

“(3) COST-OF-LIVING ADJUSTMENT.—For pur-
poses of this subsection—

“(A) IN GENERAL—The cost-of-living ad-
Justment for any calendar year is the percent-
age (if any) by which—

“(1) the C-CPI-U for the preceding
calendar year, exceeds

“() the CPI for calendar ycar 2016,
multiplied by the amount determined

under subparagraph (B).



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C

O 00 N N W b~ W N =

[\ T NG YRR NG T N YR NG T N J N Sy g S ey
W A W N = O 0NN N W= O

13
“(B) AMOUNT DETERMINED.—The
amount determined under this clause 1s the
amount obtained by dividing—
“@1) the C-CPI-U for calendar yecar
2016, by
“(i1) the CPI for calendar year 2016.
“(C) SPECIAL RULE FOR ADJUSTMENTS
WITH A BASE YEAR AFTER 2016.—For purposes
of any provision of this title which provides for
the substitution of a year after 2016 for ‘2016’
in subparagraph (A)(i1), subparagraph (A) shall
be applied by substituting ‘the C-CPI-U for cal-
endar year 2016’ for ‘the CPI for calendar year
2016’ and all that follows in clause (i) there-

Of )

(b) C-CPI-U.—Subscection (f) of seetion 1 is amended
by striking paragraph (7), by redesignating paragraph (6)
as paragraph (7), and by inserting after paragraph (5)

the following new paragraph:

“(6) C-CPI-U.—For purposes of this sub-

seetion—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘C-CPI-T
means the Chained Consumer Price Index for
All Urban Consumers (as published by the Bu-

reau of Labor Statistics of the Department of



ONOTTNOTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

oo o0 NN N B W e

e e S e S S e e S S S Sy
~NN N e AW = O

18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

14

Labor). The values of the Chained Consumer
Price Index for All Urban Consumers taken
into account for purposes of determining the
cost-of-living adjustment for any calendar year
under this subsection shall be the latest values
so published as of the date on which such Bu-
reau publishes the initial value of the Chained
Consumer Price Index for All Urban Con-
sumers for the month of August for the pre-
ceding calendar year.

“(B) DETERMINATION FOR CALENDAR
YEAR.—The C-CPI-U for any calendar year is
the average of the C-CPI-U as of the close of
the 12-month period ending on August 31 of

such calendar year.”.

(¢) APPLICATION TO PERMANENT TAX TABLES.—
Section 1(f)(2)(A) is amended by inserting , determined
by substituting ‘1992’ for ‘2016’ in paragraph (3)(A)(i1)”.

(d) ArrnicaATION TO OTHER INTERNAL REVEXNUE

CODE OF 1986 PROVISIONS.—

(1) The following scetions are cach amended by

striking “for ‘calendar year 1992’ in subparagraph
(B)” and inserting “for ‘calendar year 2016’ in sub-

paragraph (A)(i1)":

(A) Section 23(h)(2).



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN N R W N e

[ O N N R N N O R O N O B T T e e S S
wnm AW N = O O 0NN N R W ND-= O

15

(B) Paragraphs (1)(A)(ii) and (2)(A)(ii) of
section 25A(h).

(C) Section 25B(b)(3)(B).

(D)  Subsection (b)(2)(B)(11)(1I), and
clauses (1) and (i) of subsection (§)(1)(B), of
seetion 32.

(E) Section 36B(f)(2)(B) (1) (II).

(F) Section 41(e)(5)(C)(1).

(@)  Subsections  (e)(3)(D)(ii)  and
(h)(3)(H)(1)(II) of section 42.

(H) Scetion 45R(d)(3)(B)(1).

(I) Section 55(d)(4)(A)(i1).

(J) Section 62(d)(3)(B).

(K) Section 63(¢)(4)(B).

(L) Section 125(1)(2)(B).

(M) Seetion 135(b)(2)(B)(11).

(N) Section 137(f)(2).

(0) Section 146(d)(2)(B).

(P) Section 147(¢)(2)(H)(i1).

(Q) Section 151(d)(4)(B).

(R) Scetion 179(b)(6)(A)(i1).

(S)  Subsections  (b)(5)(C)(1)(II) and
(2)(8)(B) of section 219.

(T) Section 220(g)(2).

(U) Section 221(f)(1)(B).



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 0 N N L B WD

[\ TR N TR NG TR N T N T N T S S g e e e S
DN A~ W NN = O O 0NN e, WwW N = O

16
(V) Section 223(g)(1)(B).
(W) Section 408A(c¢)(3)(D)(ii).
(X) Section 430(ce)(7)(D)(vii)(1I).
(Y) Section 512(d)(2)(13).
(Z) Section 513(h)(2)(C)(ii).
(AA) Section 831(h)(2)(D)(i1).
(BB) Section 877A(a)(3)(B)(i)(II).
(CC) Section 2010(e)(3)(B)(11).
(DD) Section 2032A(a)(3)(B).
(EE) Section 2503(b)(2)(B).
(FF) Section 4261(e)(4)(A)(i1).
(GG) Section 5000A(c)(3)(D)(i1).
(HI) Section 6323(1)(4)(B).
(IT) Section 6334(g2)(1)(B).
(JJ) Section 6601()(3)(B).
(KK) Seection 6651(1)(1).
(L1 Section 6652(c)(7)(A).
(MM) Section 6695(h)(1).
(NN) Section 6698(e)(1).
(00) Section 6699(e)(1).
(PP) Section 6721(f)(1).
(QQ) Section 6722(f)(1).
(RR) Section 7345(f)(2).
(SS) Section 7430(c)(1).
(TT) Section 9831(d)(2)(D) (i) (II).



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 9 N W A~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

17
(2) Sections 41(e)(5)(C)(i1) and 68(h)(2)(B) arc

each amended—

(A) by striking “1(f)(3)(B)” and inserting
“1(E)(3)(A) (1), and

(B) by striking “1992” and inserting
“2016”.

(3) Section 42(h)(6)(G) 1s amended—

(A) by striking “for ‘calendar year 1987 ”
in clause (i)(II) and inserting ‘“for ‘calendar
year 2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof”,
and

(B) by striking “if the CPI for any cal-
endar year”’ and all that follows in clause (ii)
and inserting “if the C-CPI-U for any calendar
year (as defined in section 1(f)(6)) exceeds the
C-CPI-U for the preceding calendar year by
more than 5 percent, the C-CPI-U for the base
calendar year shall be increased such that such
excess shall never be taken into account under
clause (1). In the case of a base calendar year
before 2017, the C-CPI-U for such year shall
be determined by multiplying the CPI for such
year by the amount determined under section

1()(3)(B).”.



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N9 N AW =

— = e e e e e e e e
O o0 N N W bW NN = O

20
21
22
23
24

18

(4) Seetion 59(3)(2)(B) is amended by striking
“for ‘1992’ in subparagraph (B)” and inserting “for
‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1)”.

(5) Secetion 132(f)(6)(A)(ii) i1s amended by
striking “for ‘calendar year 1992’7 and inserting
“for ‘calendar ycar 2016’ in subparagraph (A)(ii)
thereof”.

(6) Section 162(0)(3) is amended by striking
“adjusted for changes in the Consumer Price Index
(as defined 1n section 1(f)(5)) since 1991 and in-
serting ‘“‘adjusted by inercasing any such amount
under the 1991 agreement by an amount equal to—

“(A) such amount, multiplied by

“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
year in which the taxable year begins, by sub-
stituting ‘calendar year 1990’ for ‘calendar year

2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof™.

(7) So much of clause (1) of section
213(d)(10)(B) as precedes the last sentence 1s
amended to read as follows:

“(i1)) MEDICAL CARE COST ADJUST-
MENT.—For purposes of clause (i), the

medical care cost adjustment for any cal-




O\OTT\OTT17834.xml (file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N U AW

N NN NN e ek e pma e e e e
W= O DO 00NN R WD = O

19
endar year is the percentage (if any) by
which—
“(I) the medical care component
of the C-CP’I-U (as defined in section
1(f)(6)) for August of the preceding
calendar year, exceeds
“(IT) such component of the CPI
(as defined in section 1(f)(4)) for Au-
gust of 1996, multiplied by the
amount determined under section
1(£)(3)(B).”.
(8) Subparagraph (B) of section 280F(d)(7) is
amended to read as follows:
“(B) AUTOMOBILE PRICE INFLATION AD-
JUSTMENT.—For purposes of this paragraph—
“(1) IN GENERAL.—The automobile
price inflation adjustment for any calendar
vear is the percentage (if any) by which—
“(I) the C-CPI-U automobile
component for October of the pre-
ceding calendar year, exceeds
“(IT) the automobile component
of the CPI (as defined in section

1(f)(4)) for October of 1987, multi-



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N N W hA W e

[ I N N N T N e O T N I T e S e GO Gy G G U GO Sy
L A W N = O O 00 J O W b~ W N - O

20
plied by the amount determined under
1(H)(3)(B).

“(m) C-CPI-U AUTOMOBILE COMPO-
NENT.—The term ‘C-CPI-U automobile
component’ means the automobile compo-
nent of the Chained Consumer Price Index
for All Urban Consumers (as described in
section 1(f)(6)).”.

(9) Scction 911(b)(2)(D)(i1)(II) is amended by

” and in-

striking “for ‘1992’ in subparagraph (B)
serting “for ‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1)”.

(10) Paragraph (2) of section 1274A(d) 1is
amended to read as follows:

“(2) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the
case of any debt instrument arising out of a sale or
exchange during any calendar year after 1989, cach
dollar amount contained in the preceding provisions
of this section shall be increased by an amount equal
to—

“(A) such amount, multiplied by

“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
year in which the taxable year begins, by sub-

stituting ‘calendar year 1988’ for ‘calendar year

2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof.




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N R W

NN N N N N b e kb e e e e e e
L A W N = © O 0 N O W » W N = O

21
Any inerease under the preeeding sentence shall be
rounded to the nearest multiple of $100 (or, if such
increase is a multiple of $50, such increase shall be
increased to the nearest multiple of $100).”.
(11) Section 4161(b)(2)(C)(i)(I) is amended by

7 and in-

striking “for ‘1992’ in subparagraph (B)
serting “for ‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1)”.

(12) Section 4980I(b)(3)(C)(v)(II) i1s amended
by striking ‘“for ‘1992’ in subparagraph (B)” and
mserting “for ‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(11)”.

(13) Scction 6039F(d) is amended by striking
“subparagraph (B) thereof shall be applied by sub-
stituting ‘1995’ for ‘1992’ and inserting ‘“‘subpara-
oraph (A)(i1) thereof shall be applied by substituting
‘1995’ for ‘2016,

(14) Secction 7872(g)(5) 1s amended to read as
follows:

“(5) ADJUSTMENT OF LIMIT FOR INFLATION.—
In the case of any loan made during any calendar
year after 1986, the dollar amount in paragraph (2)
shall be inereased by an amount equal to—

“(A) such amount, multiplied by
“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-

mined under scction 1(f)(3) for the calendar

year in which the taxable year begins, by sub-



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

e o0 9 N U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

22
stituting ‘calendar year 1985 for ‘calendar year
2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof.

Any increase under the preceding sentence shall be

rounded to the nearest multiple of $100 (or, if’ such

increase is a multiple of $50, such increase shall be
increased to the nearest multiple of $100).”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

PART II—DEDUCTION FOR QUALIFIED BUSINESS
INCOME OF PASS-THRU ENTITIES
SEC. 11011. DEDUCTION FOR QUALIFIED BUSINESS IN-
COME.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Part VI of subchapter B of chap-
ter 1 is amended by adding at the end the following new
seetion:

“SEC. 199A. QUALIFIED BUSINESS INCOME.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a taxpayer other
than a corporation, there shall be allowed as a deduction
for any taxable year an amount equal to the lesser of—

“(1) the combined qualified business income
amount of the taxpayer, or
“(2) an amount equal to 23 pereent of the ex-

cess (if any) of—



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

23

“(A) the taxable income of the taxpayer
for the taxable year, over

“(B) any net capital gain (as defined in
section 1(h)) of the taxpayer for the taxable
year.

“(b) COMBINED QUALIFIED DBUSINESS INCOME
AMOUNT.—For purposes of this section—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘combined quali-
fied business income amount’ means, with respecet to
any taxable year, an amount equal to—

“(A) the sum of the amounts determined
under paragraph (2) for each qualified trade or
business carried on by the taxpayer, plus

“(13) 23 pereent of the aggregate amount
of the qualified REIT dividends and qualified
cooperative dividends of the taxpayer for the
taxable year.

“(2) DETERMINATION  OF  DEDUCTIBLE
AMOUNT FOR BEACII TRADE OR BUSINESS.—The
amount determined under this paragraph with re-
speet to any qualified trade or business is the lesser
of—

“(A) 23 pereent of the taxpayer’s qualified
business income with respecet to the qualified

trade or business, or



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N9 N bW

N NN N N = ks e e e e e e e e
WD = O O 0NN DN R WD = O

24

“(B) 50 pereent of the W-2 wages with re-
spect to the qualified trade or business.

“(3) MODIFICATIONS TO THE WAGE LIMIT
BASED ON TAXABLE INCOME.—

“(A) EXCEPTION FROM WAGE LIMIT.—In
the case of any taxpayer whose taxable income
for the taxable year does not exceed the thresh-
old amount, paragraph (2) shall be applied
without regard to subparagraph (13).

“(B) PHASE-IN OF LIMIT FOR CERTAIN

TAXPAYERS.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—If—

“(I) the taxable income of a tax-
payer for any taxable year exceeds the
threshold amount, but does not exceed
the sum of the threshold amount plus
$50,000 ($100,000 in the case of a
joint return), and

“(IT) the amount determined
under paragraph (2)(B) (determined
without regard to this subparagraph)
with respect to any qualified trade or
business earried on by the taxpayer is

less than the amount determined



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N U bk~ W =

N DN N NN N = e e e e e e e
DN A LW DD = O VOV 0 N OO U W N = ©°

then

25
under paragraph (2)(A) with respeet
such trade or business,

paragraph (2) shall be applied with

respecet to such trade or business without

regard to subparagraph (B) thereof and by

reducing the amount determined under

subparagraph (A) thereof by the amount

determined under clause (i1).

“(i1) AMOUNT OF REDUCTION.—The

amount determined under this subpara-

graph is the amount which bears the same

ratio

to the excess amount as—

“(I) the amount by which the
taxpayer’s taxable income for the tax-
able year exceeds the threshold
amount, bears to

“(II) $50,000 ($100,000 in the
case of a joint return).

“(ii1) Excrss aAMOUNT.—For pur-

poses of clause (ii), the excess amount is

the exeess of—

“(I) the amount determined
under paragraph (2)(A) (determined
without regard to this paragraph),

over



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N R~ W N =

N N NN N N o b e m e e ek e
B B W NN = O O 00NN N WD~ O

26
“(IT) the amount determined
under paragraph (2)(B) (determined
without regard to this paragraph).
“(4) WAGES, ETC.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘W-2 wages’
neans, with respeet to any person for any tax-
able year of such person, the amounts described
in paragraphs (3) and (8) of section 6051(a)
paid by such person with respect to employment
of employees by such person during the ecal-
endar year ending during such taxable year.

“(B) LIMITATION TO WAGES ATTRIB-
UTABLE TO QUALIFIED BUSINESS INCOME.—
Such term shall not include any amount which
is not properly allocable to qualified business
imcome for purposes of subsection (¢)(1).

“(C) RETURN REQUIREMENT.—Such term
shall not include any amount which i1s not prop-
erly included in a return filed with the Social
Security Administration on or before the 60th
day after the duce date (including extensions)
for such return.

“(5) ACQUISITIONS, DISPOSITIONS, AND SHORT

TAXABLE YEARS.—The Scerctary shall provide for

the application of this subsection in cases of a short



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N b~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

27
taxable year or where the taxpayer acquires, or dis-
poses of, the major portion of a trade or business or
the major portion of a separate unit of a trade or
business during the taxable year.

“(e) QUALIFIED BUSINESS INCOME.—For purposes

of this seetion—

“(1) IN GEXNERAL.—The term ‘qualified busi-
ness income’ means, for any taxable year, the net
amount of qualified items of income, gain, deduc-
tion, and loss with respect to any qualified trade or
business of the taxpayer.

“(2) CARRYOVER OF LOSSES.—If the net
amount of qualified income, gain, deduction, and
loss with respect to qualified trade or businesses of
the taxpayer amount for any taxable year is less
than zero, such amount shall be treated as a loss
from a qualified trade or business in the succeeding
taxable year.

“(3) QUALIFIED ITEMS OF INCOME, GAIN, DE-

DUCTION, AND LOSS.

For purposes of this sub-
seetion—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘qualified

items of income, gain, deduction, and loss’

means items of income, gain, deduction, and

loss to the extent such items are—



w
I
@]

OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

28

1 “(1) effeetively eonnected with the con-
2 duct of a trade or business within the
3 United States (within the meaning of sec-
4 tion 864(c¢), determined by substituting
5 ‘qualified trade or business (within the
6 meaning of section 199A)° for ‘nonresident
7 alien individual or a foreign corporation’ or
8 for ‘a foreign corporation’ each place it ap-
9 pears), and

10 “(i1) included or allowed in deter-
11 mining taxable income for the taxable year.
12 “(B) ExXCEPTIONS.—The following invest-
13 ment items shall not be taken into account as
14 a qualified item of income, gain, deduction, or
15 loss:

16 “(1) Any item of short-term capital
17 gain, short-term capital loss, long-term
18 capital gain, or long-term capital loss.

19 “(i1) Any dividend, income cequivalent
20 to a dividend, or payment in lieu of divi-
21 dends deseribed 1n secetion 954(¢)(1)(G).
22 “(ii1) Any interest income other than
23 interest income which is properly allocable
24 to a trade or business.




O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N O U A~ W N =

e e e T e S e YO S i G G G
O o0 N N L AW = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

29

“(iv) Any item of gain or loss de-
scribed in subparagraph (C) or (D) of sec-
tion 954(c)(1) (applied by substituting
‘qualified trade or business’ for ‘controlled
foreign corporation’).

“(v) Any item of income, gain, deduc-
tion, or loss taken into account under sec-
tion 954(¢)(1)(F) (determined without re-
gard to clause (it) thereof and other than
items attributable to notional prineipal
contracts entered into in  transactions
qualifying under section 1221(a)(7)).

“(vi) Any amount received from an
annuity which is not received in connection
with the trade or business.

“(vi) Any item of deduction or loss
properly allocable to an amount described
in any of the preceding clauses.

“(4) TREATMENT OF REASONABLE COMP’ENSA-

TION AND GUARANTEED PAYMENTS.—Qualified busi-

ness ineome shall not inelude—
“(A) reasonable compensation paid to the
taxpayer by any qualified trade or business of
the taxpayer for services rendered with respeet

to the trade or business,



OA\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N Bt AW N

N N N N N = = o e pm e R e e e
A W NN = O O 0NN N N PWND = O

30
“(B) any guaranteed payment deseribed in
section 707(¢) paid to a partner for services
rendered with respeet to the trade or business,
and
“(C) to the extent provided in regulations,
any payment deseribed i seetion 707(a) to a
partner for services rendered with respect to the
trade or business.

“(d) QUALIFIED TRADE OR BUSINESS.—For pur-

poses of this section—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘qualified trade
or business’ means any trade or business other than
a specified service trade or business or the trade or
business of performing services as an employee.

“(2) SPECIFIED SERVICE TRADE OR BUSI-
NESS.—The term ‘speeified service trade or busi-
ness’ means any trade or business involving the per-
formance of services described in  section
1202(e)(3)(A), meluding investing and investment
management, trading, or dealing in securities (as de-
fined in seetion 475(e)(2)), partnership interests, or
commodities (as defined in section 475(e)(2)).

“(3) EXCEPTION FOR SPECIFIED SERVICE BUSI-

NESSES BASED ON TAXPAYER’S INCOME.



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O© 00 J O W B~ W N =

[\ I NS R S R O e e T e T e Y e S ey VU Gy W S
W N = O O 00NN N RN =D

31

“(A) IN GENERAL.—If, for any taxable
year, the taxable income of any taxpayer is less
than the sum of the threshold amount plus
$50,000 ($100,000 in the case of a joint re-
turn), then—

“(1) the exception under paragraph

(1) shall not apply to specified service

trades or businesses of the taxpayer for the

taxable year, but

“(i1) only the applicable percentage of
qualified items of ineome, gain, deduction,
or loss, and the W-2 wages, of the tax-
payer allocable to such specified service
trades or businesses shall be taken into ac-
count in computing the qualified business
income and W-2 wages of the taxpayer for
the taxable year for purposes of applying
this section.

“(B) APrPLICABLE PERCENTAGE.—For
purposes of subparagraph (A), the term ‘appli-
cable percentage’ means, with respeet to any
taxable year, 100 percent reduced (not below

zero) by the percentage equal to the ratio of—



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml {file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

32
1 ‘(1) the taxable income of the tax-
2 payer for the taxable year in excess of the
3 threshold amount, bears to
4 “(i1) $50,000 ($100,000 in the case of
5 a joint return).
6 “(e) OTHER DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this
7 section—
8 “(1) TAXABLE INCOME.—Taxable income shall
9 be computed without regard to the deduction allow-
10 able under this section.
11 “(2) THRESHOLD AMOUNT.—
12 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘threshold
13 amount’ means $250,000 (200 percent of such
14 amount in the case of a joint return).
15 “(B) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In the
16 case of any taxable year beginning after 2018,
17 the dollar amount in paragraph (1) shall be in-
18 creased by an amount equal to—
19 “(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by
20 “(i1) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
21 termined under seetion 1(f)(3) for the cal-
22 endar year in which the taxable year be-
23 gins, determined by substituting ‘calendar
24 year 2017 for ‘calendar ycar 2016’ in sub-

25 paragraph (A)(i1) thereof.




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N O N AW e

[ N N T N T N T N e e S S Sy G G S GO
A S I < B Vo e RS e N & T SO OO T O T S o

25

33

If any amount as increased under the preceding

sentence 1s not a multiple of $1,000, such

amount shall be rounded to the nearest multiple
of $1,000.

“(3) QUALIFIED REIT DIVIDEND.—The term
‘qualified REIT dividend” means any dividend from
a real estate investment trust received during the
taxable year which—

“(A) is not a capital gain dividend, as de-
fined in section 857(b)(3), and
“(B) 1s not qualified dividend income, as

defined in section 1(h)(11).

“(4) QUALIFIED COOPERATIVE DIVIDEND.—
The term ‘qualified cooperative dividend’ means any
patronage dividend (as defined in section 1388(a)),
any per-unit retain allocation (as defined in section
1388(f)), and any qualified written notice of alloca-
tion (as defined in section 1388(c)), or any similar
amount received from an organization described in
subparagraph (B)(ii), which—

“(A) 1s includible in gross ineome, and
“(B) 1s received from—

“(1) an organization or corporation de-
scribed in section 501(c¢)(12) or 1381(a),

or




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.

O o0 N O W AW =

[ T N T N T N T N e N g e N S G S
LD A W N = O VvV &0 N O W A WD =D

e

34

“(11) an organization which is gov-
erned under this title by the rules applica-
ble to cooperatives under this title before
the enactment of subchapter T.

“(f) SPECIAL RULES.—
“(1) APPLICATION TO PARTNERSHIPS AND S
CORPORATIONS.—
“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a part-
nership or S corporation—

“(i) this section shall be applied at the
partner or sharcholder level,

“(i1) each partner or shareholder shall
take into account such person’s allocable
share of cach qualified item of income,
gain, deduction, and loss, and

“(m) ecach partner or sharcholder
shall be treated for purposes of subsection
(b) as having W-2 wages for the taxable
year in an amount equal to such person’s
allocable share of the W-2 wages of the
partnership or S corporation for the tax-
able year (as determined under regulations
preseribed by the Seeretary).

For purposes of clause (iii), a partner’s or

shareholder’s allocable share of W-2 wages shall




O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 3 O U A~ W N e

[N N N T N R N O T L o e S e S g g N GG
LN A W N = O VWV 0 N & W h W N = ©°

35
be determined in the same manner as the part-
ner’s or sharcholder’s allocable share of wage
expenses. For purposes of this subparagraph, in
the case of an S corporation, an allocable share
shall be the shareholder’s pro rata share of an
item.

“(B) APPLICATION TO TRUSTS AND ES-
TATES.—This section shall not apply to any
trust or estate.

“(C) TREATMENT OF TRADES OR BUSI-
NESS IN PUERTO RICO.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
taxpayer with qualified business income
from sources within the commonwealth of
Puerto Rico, if all such income is taxable
under seetion 1 for such taxable year, then
for purposes of determining the qualified
business income of such taxpayer for such
taxable year, the term ‘United States’ shall
include the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico.

“(11) SPECIAL RULE FOR APPLYING
WAGE LIMITATION.—In the case of any
taxpayer described in clause (i), the deter-
mination of W-2 wages of such taxpayer

with respect to any qualified trade or busi-



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N b~ WD

[\ I N R N R O R N R N I T T - e S S S S T = T ==
Wnm A W N = O O 00NN N RARWNR O

36
ness conducted in Puerto Rico shall be
made without regard to any exclusion
under section 3401(a)(8) for remuneration
paid for services in Puerto Rico.

“(2) COORDINATION WITII MINIMUM TAX.—For
purposes of determining alternative minimum tax-
able income under section 55, qualified business in-
come shall be determined without regard to any ad-
justments under sections 56 through 59.

“(3) DEDUCTION LIMITED TO INCOME
TAXES.—The deduction under subsecetion (a) shall
only be allowed for purposes of this chapter.

“(4) REGULATIONS.—The Secretary shall pre-

scribe such regulations as are neceessary to carry out
the purposes of this section, including regulations—
“(A) for requiring or restricting the alloca-
tion of items and wages under this section and
such reporting requirements as the Secretary
determines appropriate, and
“(B) for the application of this section in
the case of tiered entities.

“(g) DEDUCTION ALLOWED TO SPECIFIED AGRICUL-

TURAL OR HORTICULTURAL COOPERATIVES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any taxable

year of a specified agricultural or horticultural coop-



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

37
erative beginning after Deeember 31, 2018, there
shall be allowed a deduction in an amount equal to
the lesser of—

“(A) 23 pereent of the cooperative’s tax-
able income for the taxable year, or

“(B) 50 pereent of the W-2 wages of the
cooperative with respect to its trade or busi-
ness.

“(2) SPECIFIED AGRICULTURAL OR IIORTI-
CULTURAL COOPERATIVE.—For purposes of this
subseetion, the term ‘specified agricultural or horti-
cultural cooperative’ means an organization to which
part I of subchapter T applies which is engaged in—

“(A) the manufacturing, production,
growth, or extraction in whole or significant
part of any agricultural or horticultural prod-
uct,

“(B) the marketing of agricultural or hor-
ticultural products which its patrons have so
manufactured, produced, grown, or extracted,
or

“(C) the provision of supplies, equipment,
or services to farmers or to organizations de-

scribed in subparagraph (A) or (B).



OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

38

“(h) TERMINATION.—This section shall not apply to

taxable years beginning after December 31, 2025.”.

(b) APPLICATION TO PUBLICLY TRADED PARTNER-

SIITPS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 199A(b)(1)(B), as
added by subscction (a), is amended by striking
“and qualified cooperative dividends” and inserting
“, qualified cooperative dividends, and qualified pub-
licly traded partnership income”.

(2) QUALIFIED PUBLICLY TRADED PARTNER-
SHIP INCOME.—Scction 199A(e), as added by sub-
section (a), is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing new paragraph:

“(5) QUALIFIED PUBLICLY TRADED PARTNER-
SHIP INCOME.—The term ‘qualified publicly traded
partnership income’ means, with respeet to any
qualified trade or business of a taxpayer, the sum
of—

“(A) the net amount of such taxpayer’s al-
locable share of each qualified item of income,
gain, deduction, and loss (as defined in sub-
section (¢)(3) and determined after the applica-
tion of subsection (¢)(4)) from a publicly traded

partnership (as defined in section 7704(a))



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

© 0 N N U A W N

[ T N N T N T N e e Y e e g UG G GG ey
A~ W DN = O O 0NN NNl WD = O

39
which 1s not treated as a corporation under see-
tion 7704(¢), plus
“(B) any gain recognized by such taxpayer
upon disposition of its interest in such partner-
ship to the extent such gain is treated as an
amount realized from the sale or exchange of
property other than a capital asset under sec-
tion 751(a).”.

(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section

199A(e)(1), as added by subsection (a), is amended

by adding at the end the following new sentence:

“Such term shall not include any qualified publicly

traded partnership income.”.

(¢) ACCURACY-RELATED PENALTY ON DETERMINA-
TION OF APPLICABLE PERCENTAGE.—Section 6662(d)(1)
1s amended by inserting at the end the following new sub-

paragraph:

“(C) SPECIAL RULE FOR TAXPAYERS

CLAIMING SECTION 199A DEDUCTION.—In the
case of any taxpayer who claims the deduction
allowed under scetion 199A for the taxable
year, subparagraph (A) shall be applied by sub-

 »

stituting ‘5 percent’ for ‘10 percent’.”.

(d) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 NN O U AW =

N N N NN = = = e e e ek e e
W N = O O 00NN A WD = O

40

(1) Section 170(b)(2)(D) is amended by strik-
ing ‘}, and” at the end of clause (iv), by redesig-
nating clause (v) as clause (vi), and by inserting
after clause (iv) the following new clause:

“(v) section 199A, and”.

(2) Section 172(d) is amended by adding at the
end the following new paragraph:

“(8) QUALIFIED BUSINESS INCOME DEDUC-
TION.—The deduction under section 199A shall not
be allowed.”.

(3) Seection 246(bh)(1) is amended by inserting
“199A,” before “243(a)(1)”.

(4) Section 613(a) is amended by inserting
“and without the deduction under section 199A”
after “and without the deduction under section
199”.

(5) Section 613A(d)(1) is amended by redesig-
nating subparagraphs (C), (D), and (E) as subpara-
graphs (D), (E), and (F), respectively, and by in-
serting after subparagraph (B), the following new
subparagraph:

“(C) any deduction allowable under section

199A,”.



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N W A

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

41
(6) The table of sections for part VI of sub-

chapter B of chapter 1 is amended by inserting at

the end the following new item:

“Sec. 199A. Qualified business income.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11012. LIMITATION ON LOSSES FOR TAXPAYERS

OTHER THAN CORPORATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Secction 461 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:

“(1) LIMITATION ON EXCESS BUSINESS LOSSES OF
NONCORPORATE TAXPAYERS.—

“(1) LiMITATION.—In the case of taxable year
of a taxpayer other than a corporation beginning
after December 31, 2017, and before January 1,
2026—

“(A) subsection (j) (relating to limitation
on excess farm losses of certain taxpayers) shall
not apply, and

“(B) any excess business loss of the tax-
payer for the taxable year shall not be allowed.
“(2) DISALLOWED LOSS CARRYOVER.—Any loss

which is disallowed under paragraph (1) shall be

treated as a net operating loss carryover to the fol-

lowing taxable year under section 172.



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N O W s~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

w
&
!

42
“(3) EXCESS BUSINESS LOSS.—For purposes of
this subsection—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘excess busi-
ness loss” means the excess (if any) of—

“(i) the aggregate deductions of the
taxpayer for the taxable year which are at-
tributable to trades or businesses of such
taxpayer (determined without regard to
whether or not such deductions are dis-
allowed for such taxable year under para-
graph (1)), over

“(i1) the sum of—

“(I) the aggregate gross income
or gain of such taxpayer for the tax-
able year which is attributable to such
trades or businesses, plus

“(IT) $250,000 (200 pereent of
such amount in the case of a joint re-
turn).

“(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In
the case of any taxable year beginning after De-
cember 31, 2018, the $250,000 amount in sub-
paragraph (A)(i1)(II) shall be increased by an

amount equal to—

“(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

43

1 “(11) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
2 termined under section 1(f)(3) for the cal-
3 endar year in which the taxable year be-
4 gins, determined by substituting ‘2017’ for
5 ‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof.

6 If any amount as increased under the pre-
7 ceding sentence is not a multiple of
8 $1,000, such amount shall be rounded to
9 the nearest multiple of $1,000.

10 “(4) APPLICATION OF SUBSECTION IN CASE OF
11 PARTNERSHIPS AND 8 CORPORATIONS.—In the ecase
12 of a partnership or S corporation—

13 “(A) this subsection shall be applied at the
14 partner or sharcholder level, and

15 “(B) each partner’s or shareholder’s allo-
16 cable sharce of the items of income, gain, deduc-
17 tion, or loss of the partnership or S corporation
18 for any taxable year from trades or businesses
19 attributable to the partnership or S corporation
20 shall be taken into account by the partner or
21 sharcholder in applying this subsection to the
22 taxable year of such partner or shareholder
23 with or within which the taxable year of the
24 partnership or S corporation ends.



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N O B W N -

l\)‘l\) N (V] NN —_— —_ —_ — — [ [ — —
D A W N = O VvV 00 NN O U A~AWND-=, O

44
For purposes of this paragraph, in the case of an S
corporation, an allocable share shall be the share-
holder’s pro rata share of an item.

“(5) ADDITIONAL REPORTING.—The Sccretary
shall preseribe such additional reporting require-
ments as the Seerctary determines appropriate to
carry out the purposes of this subsection.

“(6) COORDINATION WITH SECTION 469.—This
subscction shall be applied after the application of
section 469.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.
PART III—TAX BENEFITS FOR FAMILIES AND

INDIVIDUALS

SEC. 11021. INCREASE IN STANDARD DEDUCTION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (¢) of section 63 is

amended by adding at the end the following new para-

graph:

“(7) SPECIAL RULES FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018
THROUGH 2025.—In the case of a taxable year begin-
ning after December 31, 2017, and before January
1, 2026—

“(A) INCREASE IN STANDARD DEDUC-

TION.—Paragraph (2) shall be applied—



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N R W -

N N N = e e e e e e e e e
N = O O 0NN N R W N = O

23

45

“(i) by substituting ‘$18,000’ for
‘$4,400’ in subparagraph (B), and

“(i1) by substituting ‘$12,000" for
‘$3,000’ in subparagraph (C).

“(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—

“(i) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (4)
shall not apply to the dollar amounts con-
tained in paragraphs (2)(B) and (2)(C).

“(11) ADJUSTMENT OF INCREASED
AMOUNTS.—In the case of a taxable year
beginning after 2018, the $18,000 and
$12,000 amounts in subparagraph (A)
shall each be increased by an amount equal
to—

“(I) such dollar amount, multi-
plied by
“(IT) the cost-of-living adjust-

ment determined under section 1(f)(3)

for the calendar year in which the tax-

able year begins, determined by sub-
stituting ‘2017 for ‘2016’ in subpara-

graph (A)(i1) thereof.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

24 this scction shall apply to taxable years beginning after

25 December 31, 2017.



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

46
1 SEC. 11022. INCREASE IN AND MODIFICATION OF CHILD

2 TAX CREDIT.

3 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 24 is amended by adding

4 at the end the foliowing new subsection:

5 “(h) SPECIAL RULES FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018

6 THROUGH 2025.—

7 “(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a taxable

8 year beginning after December 31, 2017, and before

9 January 1, 2026, this sectlon [s}%a e a%phed as

10 provided in paragraphs 2)-shreﬁglg (8). J,\/\ he poet A

11 “(2) CREDIT AMOUNT.—Subseetlon a) s%fa’llvfgr m(,M::fgl \‘1~
12 applied by substituting ‘$2,000” for ‘$1,000’. a;‘:ecg oH o-:t/ ;»12:\%5
13 “(3) LiMrTATION.—In lieu of the amount deter- Y2t applicd as

Provided (i Parage

14 mined under subsection (b)(2), the threshold amount (‘D

15 shall be $500,000.

16 “(4) DEFINITION OF QUALIFYING CHILD.—

17 Paragraph (1) of subsection (c) shall be applied by

18 substituting ‘18’ for ‘17’

19 “(5) PARTIAL CREDIT ALLOWED FOR CERTAIN
20 OTHER DEPENDENTS.—

21 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The credit determined

22 under subsection (a) (after the application of
23 paragraph (2)) shall be increased by $500 for

24 each dependént of the taxpayer (as defined in
25 section 152) other than a qualifying child de-




‘ ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.
|
|

47

1 seribed In subsection (¢) (after the applieation
2 of paragraph (4)).

3 “(B) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN NONCITI-
4 ZENS.—Subparagraph (A) shall not apply with
5 respect to any individual who would not be a
6 dependent if  subparagraph (A) of secction
7 152(b)(3) were applied without regard to all
8 that follows ‘resident of the United States’.

9 “(6) MAXIMUM AMOUNT OF REFUNDABLE
10 CREDIT.—

11 “(A) IN GENERAL.—Subscction (d)(1)(A)
12 shall be applied without regard to paragraphs
13 (2) and (5) of this subsection.

14 “(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In
15 the case of a taxable year beginning after 2017,
16 subscetion (d)(1)(A) shall be applied as if the
17 $1,000 amount in subsection (a) were increased
18 (but not to exceed the amount under paragraph
19 (2) of this subsecction) by an amount equal to—
20 “(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by
21 “(11) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
22 termined under section 1(f)(3) for the cal-
23 endar year in which the taxable year be-
24 oins.




O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 J AN L B WO -

[N I I T s T e T oy Sy UG G U G W
S O 00 N N N AW = O

21

48

Any increase determined under the preceding
sentence shall be rounded to the next highest
multiple of $100.

“(7) EARNED INCOME TIIRESIIOLD FOR RE-
FUNDABLE CREDIT.—Subsection (d)(1)(B)(i) shall
be applied by substituting ‘$2,500’ for ‘$3,000’.

“(8) SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER REQUIRED.—
No credit shall be allowed under subsection (d) to a
taxpayer with respect to any qualifying child unless
the taxpayer includes the social security number of
such child on the return of tax for the taxable year.
For purposes of the preceding sentence, the term
‘social security number’ means a social security
number issued to an individual by the Social Secu-
rity Administration, but only if the social security
number 1s issued to a citizen of the United States
or is issued pursuant to subclause (I) (or that por-
tion of subclause (III) that relates to subclause (I))
of section 205(¢)(2)(B)(i) of the Social Security
Act.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

22 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

23 December 31, 2017.




O\NOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

49

1 SEC. 11023. INCREASED LIMITATION FOR CERTAIN CHARI-
2 TABLE CONTRIBUTIONS.
3 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 170(b)(1) 1s amended by
4 redesignating subparagraph (G) as subparagraph (H) and
5 by inserting after subparagraph (F) the following new
6 subparagraph:
7 “((3) INCREASED LIMITATION FOR CASH
8 CONTRIBUTIONS.—
9 “(i) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
10 contribution of cash to an organization de-
11 scribed in subparagraph (A), the total
12 amount of such contributions which may
13 be taken into account under subsection (a)
14 for any taxable year beginning after De-
15 cember 31, 2017, and before January 1,
16 2026, shall not exceed 60 percent of the
17 taxpayer’s contribution base for such year.
18 “(i1)) CARRYOVER.—If the aggregate
19 amount of contributions deseribed in clause
| 20 (1) exeeeds the applicable limitation under
21 clause (i) for any taxable year described in
22 such clause, such excess shall be treated
23 (In a manner consistent with the rules of
24 subsection (d)(1)) as a charitable contribu-
‘ 25 tion to which clause (i) applies in cach of
| 26 the 5 succeeding years in order of time.




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file :

[S—

of 5] S.L.C.

“(111) COORDINATION WITH SUBPARA-

GRAPHS (A) AND (B).—

O o0 N N W B~ W

[ Y N T N T N T S S g S e S T
W N = O O 0N N AW DN = O

“(I) IN GENERAL.—Contribu-
tions taken into account under this
| subparagraph shall not be taken into
account under subparagraph (A).

“(II) LIMITATION REDUCTION.—
For each taxable year described in
clause (1), and cach taxable ycar to
which any econtribution under this
subparagraph is carried over under
clause (1), subparagraph (A) shall be
applied by reducing (but not below
zero) the contribution limitation al-
lowed for the taxable year under such
subparagraph by the aggregate con-
tributions allowed under this subpara-
graph for such taxable year, and sub-
paragraph (B) shall be applied by
treating any reference to subpara-
graph (A) as a reference to both sub-

paragraph (A) and this subpara-

graph.”.



OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N U bW ==

NN NN N N /) e e e e e ek pm e
Wn A W N = O VvV 0 N O W bMWD - O

51

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to contributions in taxable years
beginning after December 31, 2017.
SEC. 11024. INCREASED CONTRIBUTIONS TO ABLE AC-

COUNTS.

(a) INCREASE IN LIMITATION FOR CONTRIBUTIONS

FrROM COMPENSATION OF INDIVIDUALS WITH DISABIL-

ITIES.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Scction 529A(b)(2)(B) 1s
amended to read as follows:

“(B) exeept in the case of contributions
under subsection (¢)(1)(C), if such contribution
to an ABLE account would result in aggregate
contributions from all contributors to the
ABLE account for the taxable year exceeding
the sum of—

“(1) the amount in effect under sec-
tion 2503(b) for the calendar year in which
the taxable year begins, plus

“(11) m the case of any contribution
by a designated beneficiary deseribed in
paragraph (7) before January 1, 2026, the
lesser of—

“(I) compensation (as defined by

section 219(f)(1)) includible in the



0\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N U B W

N NN N N e e
R B I R BT 53 3 &G 52 & o = o

52
designated beneficiary’s gross income
for the taxable year, or
‘“(II) an amount equal to the
poverty line for a one-person house-
hold, as determined for the calendar
year preceding the calendar year in
which the taxable year begins.”.
'@9?1;\4; ity
(2) DIsBEIY FOR' CONTRIBUTION LIMITA-
TION.—Paragraph (2) of section 529A(b) is amend-
ed by adding at the end the following: “A designated
beneficiary (or a person acting on behalf of such
beneficiary) shall maintain adequate records for pur-
poses of ensuring, and shall be responsible for ensur-
ing, that the requirements of subparagraph (B)(ii)
are met.”
(3) ELIGIBLE DESIGNATED BENEFICIARY.—

Section 529A(b) is amended by adding at the end

the following:

“(7) SPECIAL RULES RELATED TO CONTRIBU-
TION LIMIT.—For purposes of  paragraph
(2)(B)(ii)—

“(A) DESIGNATED BENEFICIARY.—A des-
ignated beneficiary described in this paragraph

is an employee (including an employee within



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

53
1 the meaning of section 401(e)) with respect to
2 whom—
3 “(1) no contribution is made for the
4 taxable year to a defined contribution plan
5 (within the meaning of section 414(i)) with
6 respeet to which the requirements of see-
7 tion 401(a) or 403(a) are met,
8 “(11) no contribution is made for the
9 taxable year to an annuity contract de-
10 scribed in section 403(b), and
11 “(111) no contribution is made for the
12 taxable year to an eligible deferred com-
13 pensation plan described in section 457(b).
14 “(B) Poverry LINE.—The term ‘poverty
15 line’ has the meaning given such term by see-
16 tion 673 of the Community Servieces Block
17 Grant Act (42 U.S.C. 9902).”.
18 (b) ALLOWANCE OF SAVER’S CREDIT FOR ABLE
19 CONTRIBUTIONS BY AcCCOUNT  HOLDER.—Secction

[\S]
)

25B(d)(1) is amended by striking “and” at the end of sub-

N}
[um—

paragraph (B)(i1), by striking the period at the end of sub-

N
[\

paragraph (C) and inserting “, and”, and by inserting at

23 the end the following:
24 “(D) the amount of contributions made be-
25 fore January 1, 2026, by such individual to the



OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.
54
1 ABLE account (within the mecaning of seetion
529A) of which such individual is the des-
ignated beneficiary.”.
(¢) EFFrECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

2

3

4

5

6 the date of the enactment of this Act.
7 SEC. 11025. ROLLOVERS TO ABLE PROGRAMS FROM 529
8 PROGRAMS.

9

(a) IN GENERAL.—Clause (i) of seetion 529(¢)(3)(C)

)

10 is amended by striking “or” at the end of subclause (I),
11 by striking the period at the end of subelause (II) and

12 inserting “, or”’, and by adding at the end the following:

13 “(III) before January 1, 2026, to
14 an ABLE account (as defined in sce-
15 tion 529A(e)(6)) of the designated
16 beneficiary or a member of the family
17 of the designated beneficiary.

18 Subclause (III) shall not apply to so much
19 of a distribution which, when added to all
20 other contributions made to the ABLE ac-
21 count for the taxable year, exceeds the him-
22 itation under section 529A(b)(2)(B)(1).”.
23 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

24 this scction shall apply to distributions after the date of

25 the enactment of this Act.




i

0\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.
05

1 SEC. 11026. TREATMENT OF CERTAIN INDIVIDUALS PER-

2 FORMING SERVICES IN THE SINAI PENIN-
3 SULA OF EGYPT.
4 (a) IN GENERAL.—For purposes of the following pro-
5 wisions of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, with respeet
6 to the applicable period, a qualified hazardous duty area
7 shall be treated in the same manner as if it were a combat
8 zone (as determined under section 112 of such Code):
9 (1) Section 2(a)(3) (relating to special rule
10 where deceased spouse was in missing status).
11 (2) Section 112 (relating to the exclusion of
12 certain combat pay of members of the Armed
13 Forces).
14 (3) Section 692 (relating to income taxes of
15 members of Armed Forees on death).
16 (4) Section 2201 (relating to members of the
17 Armed Forces dying in combat zone or hy reason of
18 combat-zone-incurred wounds, ete.).
19 (5) Section 3401(a)(1) (defining wages relating
20 to combat pay for members of the Armed Forees).
21 (6) Section 4253(d) (relating to the taxation of
22 phone service originating from a combat zone from
23 members of the Armed Forees).
24 (7) Section 6013(f)(1) (relating to joint return
25 where individual is in missing status).




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN O AW e

[\ N N T N T N T e T S S ey ST G SO S G S Sy
W N = O O 0 N N N R~ W=, O

b6
(8) Secction 7508 (relating to time for per-
forming certain acts postponed by reason of service
in combat zone).

(b) QuALIFIED HAzARDOUS DuTy AREA.—For pur-
poses of this section, the term ‘“qualified hazardous duty
arca” means the Sinai Peninsula of Egypt, if as of the
date of the enactment of this section any member of the
Armed Forces of the United States is entitled to special
pay under section 310 of title 37, United States Code (re-
lating to special pay; duty subject to hostile fire or immi-
nent danger), for services performed in such loecation.
Such term includes such location only during the period
such entitlement is in effect.

(¢) APPLICABLE PERIOD.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in para-
graph (2), the applicable period is—

(A) the portion of the first taxable year
ending after June 9, 2015, which begins on
such date, and

(B) any subsequent taxable year beginning
before January 1, 2026.

(2) WITHHOLDING.—In the case of subsection

(a)(5), the applicable period is—




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN N B b W=

[\ T N T NG N N I e T e T e T T o S =
W NN = O v 00 N N b WwWND-= O

57
(A) the portion of the first taxable year
ending after the date of the enactment of this

Act which begins on such date, and

(B) any subsequent taxable year beginning

before January 1, 2026.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in para-
graph (2), the provisions of this section shall take
effect on June 9, 2015.

(2) WITHHHOLDING.—Subsection (a)(5) shall
apply to remuncration paid after the date of the en-
actment of this Act.

SEC. 11027. EXTENSION OF WAIVER OF LIMITATIONS WITH
RESPECT TO EXCLUDING FROM GROSS IN-
COME AMOUNTS RECEIVED BY WRONGFULLY
INCARCERATED INDIVIDUALS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 304(d) of the Protecting
Americans from Tax Hikes Act of 2015 (26 U.S.C. 139F
note) is amended by striking “1-year” and inserting ““2-
year’.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall take effect on the date of the enactment

of this Act.



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 0 N4 &N U B~WON e

N N N N N = M e ek e e e e
A W NN = O 0O 00NN NN DR W e O

58
SEC. 11028. TEMPORARY REDUCTION IN MEDICAL EXPENSE
DEDUCTION FLOOR.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (f) of section 213 is
amended to read as follows:

“(f) SpECIAL RULES FOR 2013 THROUGH 2018.—
In the case of any taxable year—

“(1) beginning after December 31, 2012, and
ending before January 1, 2017, in the case of a tax-
payer if such taxpayer or such taxpayer’s spouse has
attained age 65 before the close of such taxable
year, and

“(2) beginning after December 31, 2016, and
ending before January 1, 2019, in the case of any
taxpayer,

subsection (a) shall be applied with respect to a taxpayer
by substituting ‘7.5 pereent’ for ‘10 percent’.”.

(b) MINIMUM TAX PREFERENCE NOT TO APPLY.—
Section 56(b)(1)(B) is amended by adding at the end the
following new sentence: This subparagraph shall not
apply to taxable years beginning after Deeember 31, 2016,
and ending before January 1, 2019”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

December 31, 2016.




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

1

O 00 N O »n s~ WD

N NN NN N kb = e em e e ek b e
nh H W N = O VW 00 J & W b W N = O

59
SEC. 11029. RELIEF FOR 2016 DISASTER AREAS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—For purposes of this section, the
term “2016 disaster area’”’ means any area with respect
to which a major disaster has been declared by the Presi-
dent under section 401 of the Robert T. Stafford Disaster
Relief and Emergency Assistance Act during calendar year
2016.

(b) SPECIAL RULES FOR USE OF RETIREMENT
FuNDs WITH RESPECT TO AREAS DAMAGED BY 2016

DISASTERS.

(1) TAX-FAVORED WITHDRAWALS FROM RE-
TIREMENT PLANS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 72(t) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 shall not apply to
any qualified 2016 disaster distribution.

(B) AGGREGATE DOLLAR LIMITATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—For purposes of
this subsection, the aggregate amount of
distributions received by an individual

which may be treated as qualified 2016

disaster distributions for any taxable year

shall not exceed the excess (if any) of—
(I) $100,000, over

(IT) the aggregate amounts treat-

ed as qualified 2016 disaster distribu-




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 NN N R WN

N N N N N N o o e ek e e e e e
DN A W NN = O Y 0NN N RAWN = O

60

tions received by such individual for

all prior taxable years.

(1) TREATMENT OF PLAN DISTRIBU-
TIONS.—If a distribution to an individual
would (without regard to clause (i)) be a
qualified 2016 disaster distribution, a plan
shall not be treated as violating any re-
quirement of this title merely because the
plan treats such distribution as a qualified
2016 disaster distribution, unless the ag-
gregate amount of such distributions from
all plans maintained by the employer (and
any member of any controlled group which
includes the employer) to such individual
exceeds $100,000.

(ii1) CONTROLLED GROUP.—For pur-
poses of clause (i1), the term “controlled
group”’ means any group treated as a sin-
gle employer under subsecction (b), (¢),
(m), or (o) of section 414 of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986.

(C) AMOUNT DISTRIBUTED MAY BE RE-

PAID.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Any individual who

receives a qualified 2016 disaster distribu-



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N9 N W R W -

N N N N N N = o b e b e e e e
L W N = O O 00NN N W= o

61
tion may, at any time during the 3-year
period beginning on the day after the date
on which such distribution was received,
make onc or more contributions in an ag-
gregate amount not to exceed the amount
of such distribution to an cligible retire-
ment plan of which such individual is a
beneficiary and to which a rollover con-
tribution of such distribution could be
made under section 402(c), 403(a)(4),
403(b)(8), 408(d)(3), or 457(e)(16) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as the
case may be.

(1) TREATMENT OF REPAYMENTS OF
DISTRIBUTIONS FROM ELIGIBLE RETIRE-
MENT PLANS OTHER THAN IRAS.—For
purposes of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986, if a contribution is made pursuant
to clause (1) with respeet to a qualified
2016 disaster distribution from an eligible
retirement plan other than an individual
retirement plan, then the taxpayer shall, to
the extent of the amount of the contribu-

tion, be treated as having received the

qualified 2016 disaster distribution in an




O\NOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

62
1 eligible rollover distribution (as defined in
2 section 402(¢)(4) of the Internal Revenue
3 Code of 1986) and as having transferred
4 the amount to the cligible retirement plan
| 5 in a direct trustee to trustee transfer with-
6 in 60 days of the distribution.
7 (i) TREATMENT OF REPAYMENTS
8 FOR DISTRIBUTIONS FROM IRAS.—For
9 purposes of the Internal Revenue Code of
10 1986, if a contribution is made pursuant
11 to clause (1) with respeet to a qualified
12 2016 disaster distribution from an indi-
13 vidual retirément plan (as defined by sec-
14 tion 7701(a)(37) of the Internal Revenue
15 Code of 1986), then, to the extent of the
16 amount of the contribution, the qualified
17 2016 disaster distribution shall be treated
18 as a distribution described in section
19 408(d)(3) of such Code and as having been
20 transferred to the eligible retirement plan
21 in a dircet trustee to trustee transfer with-
22 in 60 days of the distribution.
23 (D) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this
24 paragraph—
|
|




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

63
1 (1) QUALIFIED 2016 DISASTER DIS-
2 TRIBUTION.—HExcept as provided in sub-
3 paragraph (B), the term “qualified 2016
4 disaster distribution” means any distribu-
5 tion from an eligible retirement plan made
6 on or after January 1, 2016, and before
7 January 1, 2018, to an individual whose
8 principal place of abode at any time during
9 calendar year 2016 was located in a dis-
10 aster area deseribed in subsection (a) and
11 who has sustained an cconomie loss by rea-
12 son of the events giving rise to the Presi-
13 dential declaration described in subsection
14 (a) which was applicable to such area.
15 (1) ELIGIBLE RETIREMENT PLAN.—
16 The term “cligible retirement plan” shall
17 have the meaning given such term by sec-
18 tion 402(c)(8)(B) of the Internal Revenue
19 Code of 1986.
20 (E) INCOME INCLUSION SPREAD OVER 3-
21 YEAR PERIOD.—
22 (1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
23 qualified 2016 disaster distribution, unless
24 the taxpayer clects not to have this sub-
25 paragraph apply for any taxable year, any




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 NN N B bW =

N N N N N e e e e e e e e
A W DN = O VO 0NN N R W= O

64
amount required to be included in gross in-
come for such taxable year shall be so in-
cluded ratably over the 3-taxable-year pe-
riod beginning with such taxable year.

(i) SPECIAL RULE.—For purposes of
clause (1), rules similar to the rules of sub-
paragraph (E) of section 408A(d)(3) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 shall apply.
(F) SPECIAL RULES.—

(1) EXEMPTION OF DISTRIBUTIONS
FROM TRUSTEE TO TRUSTEE TRANSFER
AND WITHHOLDING RULES.—For purposes
of sections 401(a)(31), 402(f), and 3405 of
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, quali-
fied 2016 disaster distribution shall not be
treated as eligible rollover distributions.

(1) QUALIFIED 2016 DISASTER DIS-
TRIBUTIONS TREATED AS MEETING PLAN
DISTRIBUTION REQUIREMENTS.—For pur-
poses of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986, a qualified 2016 disaster distribu-
tion shall be treated as meeting the re-
quirements of sections 401(k)(2)(B)(@),
403(b)(7)(A)(11), 403(b)(11), and




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

65
1 457(d)(1)(A) of the Internal Revenue Code
2 of 1986.
3 (2) PROVISIONS RELATING TO PLAN AMEND-
4 MENTS.—
5 (A) IN GENERAL.—If this paragraph ap-
6 plics to any amendment to any plan or annuity
7 contract, such plan or contract shall be treated
8 as being operated in accordance with the terms
9 of the plan during the period described in sub-
10 paragraph (B)(i1)(I).
11 (B) AMENDMENTS TO WHICH SUBSECTION
12 APPLIES.—
13 (1) IN GENERAL.—This paragraph
14 shall apply to any amendment to any plan
15 or annuity contract which is made—
16 (I) pursuant to any provision of
17 this section, or pursuant to any regu-
18 lation under any provision of this sec-
19 tion; and
20 (II) on or before the last day of
21 the first plan year beginning on or
22 after January 1, 2018, or such later
23 date as the Secretary prescribes.
24 In the case of a governmental plan (as de-
25 fined in section 414(d) of the Internal Rev-




OAOTT\OTT17834.xm! [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

66

1 enue Code of 1986), subclause (IT) shall be
2 applied by substituting the date which is 2
3 vears after the date otherwise applied
4 under subclause (I11).
5 (11) CoONDITIONS.—This  paragraph
6 shall not apply to any amendment unless—
7 (I) during the period—
8 (aa) beginning on the date
9 that this section or the regulation
10 described in clause (i)(I) takes
11 effeet (or in the case of a plan or
12 contract amendment not required
13 by this section or such regula-
14 tion, the effective date specified
15 by the plan); and
16 (bb) ending on the date de-
17 seribed in elause (1)(IT) (or, if
18 earlier, the date the plan or con-
19 tract amendment is adopted),
20 the plan or contract is operated as if
21 such plan or contract amendment
22 were in effect; and
23 (II) such plan or contract amend-
24 ment applies retroactively for such pe-

25

riod.




O\OTT\OTT17834.xnl [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

67

1 (e) SPECIAL RULES FOR PERSONAL CASUALTY
2 LoOSSES RELATED TO 2016 MAJOR DISASTER.—

3 (1) IN GENERAL.—If an individual has a net
4 disaster loss for any taxable year beginning after
5 December 31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026—
6 (A) the amount determined under seetion
7 165(h)(2)(A)(11) of the Internal Revenue Code
8 of 1986 shall be equal to the sum of—

9 (i) such net disaster loss, and

10 (i1) so much of the excess referred to
11 in the matter preceding clause (i) of see-
12 tion 165(h)(2)(A) of such Code (reduced
13 by the amount in clause (i) of this éub-
14 paragraph) as exceeds 10 percent of the
15 adjusted gross income of the individual,

16 (B) scetion 165(h)(1) of such Code shall
17 - be applied by substituting “$500” for “$500
18 ($100 for taxable years beginning after Decem-
19 ber 31, 2009)”,
20 (C) the standard deduction determined
21 under seetion 63(¢) of such Code shall be in-
22 ~creased by the net disaster loss, and
23 (D) section 56(b)(1)(E) of such Code shall

24 not apply to so much of the standard deduction




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N W kWD

e e e N e S Sy G U G U Gy
o N N R WD = O

19

68
as 1is attributable to the inercase under sub-
paragraph (C) of this paragraph.
(2) NET DISASTER LOSS.—For purposes of this

[4

subsection, the term “net disaster loss” means the
excess of qualified disaster-related personal casualty
losses over personal casualty gains (as defined in
section 165(h)(3)(A) of the Internal Revenue Code
of 1986).

(3) QUALIFIED DISASTER-RELATED PERSONAL
CASUALTY LOSSES.—For purposes of this para-
graph, the termm “qualified disaster-related personal
casualty losses” means losses desceribed in section
165(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986
which arise in a disaster arca desceribed in subsection
(a) on or after January 1, 2016, and which are at-
tributable to the events giving rise to the Presi-
dential declaration deseribed in subsection (a) which
was applicable to such area.

PART IV—EDUCATION

20 SEC. 11031. TREATMENT OF STUDENT LOANS DISCHARGED

21
22

ON ACCOUNT OF DEATH OR DISABILITY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 108(f) is amended by

23 adding at the end the following new paragraph:
24
25

“(5) DISCHARGES ON ACCOUNT OF DEATH OR

DISABILITY.—




o
&
o

OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

69
1 “(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of an indi-
2 vidual, gross income for any taxable year begin-
3 ning after December 31, 2017, and before Jan-
4 uary 1, 2026, does not include any amount
5 which (but for this subsection) would be includ-
6 ible in gross income for such taxable year by
7 reasons of the discharge (in whole or in part)
8 of any loan described in subparagraph (B) if
9 such discharge was—
10 “(1) pursuant to subsection (a) or (d)
11 of scetion 437 of the Higher Eduecation
12 Act of 1965 or the parallel benefit under
13 part D of title IV of such Aect (relating to
14 the repayment of loan liability),
15 “(11) pursuant to section 464(c)(1)(F)
16 of such Act, or
17 “(i11) otherwise discharged on account
18 of the death or total and permanent dis-
19 ability of the student.
20 “(B) LOANS DESCRIBED.—A loan 1s de-
21 seribed in this subparagraph if such loan is—
22 “(1) a student loan (as defined in
23 paragraph (2)), or
24 “(11) a private education loan (as de-
25 fined in section 140(7) of the Consumer



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml {file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

NN NN N N ek e e e e e e e e
W B W NN = O OV 00N YN AW = O

O 00 N O W A~ WD

70
Credit Protection Act (15 TU.S.C.

1650(7))).”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to discharges of indebtedness after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11032. INCREASE IN DEDUCTION FOR TEACHER EX-
PENSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (D) of section
62(a)(2) is amended by striking “$250” and inserting
“$250 ($500 in the case of taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026)”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11033. DEDUCTION FOR TUITION PAYMENTS FOR

UALIFIED RELIGIOUS INSTRUCT

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 170 is gmfended by redes-

ti in para-

graph (2) shall be treated as a charitable condxbu-




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

71
1 “(2) AMOUNT DESCRIBED.—For purposes of
2 paragraph (1), an amount is described in this para-
3 graph if—
4 “(A) such amount wduld be treated as pay-
5 ent of qualified tuition|and related expenses
6 urposes of section 25A(f)(1) but for the
7 fact thatsuch payment iy made to a primary or
8 secondary edwcational organization described in
9 subparagraph (b){l)(A)(it) rather than an eligi-
10 ble educational instithion (as defined in section
11 25A(f)(2)),
12 “(B) such payment is\made after Decem-
13 ber 31, 2018, and beforg 1, 2021,
14 “(C) such organizption cerdifies that 30
15 percent of the instructiqn it provides\each aca-
16 demic year consists off qualified religibus in-
17 struction, and
18 “(D) such organization has provided t
19 taxpayer a statement which contains the infor- k\\
20 mation required by secti¢n 6050Z. |
21 “(3) QUALIFIED RELIGIOUS INSTRUCTION.— \
22 For purposes of this subsectipn, the term ‘qualified "\
'23 religious instruction’ means afpademic instruction or | \
24 training regarding a particulai religion (including te- “
25 nets, doctrines, beliefs, rituals,|customs, and rites) of ]




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.LC.
72

1 a typs not generally offered in public school cur-
2 ricula, wich is provided by a teacher 6r other in-
3 had significant
4 ief.

5 ENEFIT.—No deduction
6 r this subsection for the
7 amount of any expense for\yhich a deduction, credit,
8 allowed to thy taxpayer under any
9

10

11 part III of
12 by sections
13 13306 and 13518, is amended by adding &t the end
14 the following new section:

15 “SE N6050Z. RETURNS RELATING TO TUIT FOR QUALI-

N N N red ed e
NoO= OO0 0N N
=)
é
=
o=
P—hED/
g
av
w
5/ &
Q
ngg.
5 2 B B
& 8 =
g = B F
=2 g &
2 = ° g
~ e
ggmo
=5 2 3
= 3 E o
g 3
2 5 ? 9

such time/as the Secretary may by regulations prdgeribe,

N
(8]

whichontains:




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 3 O Ut B W=

[N T N R R T T e S e G Gy VI Gy SH G VT O Y
— O O 00 NN DR W =D

22
23

73

S.L.C.

“(1) the name, addrerss, and TIN of the indi-

vidual with respect to

related expenses are rec

whpm tuition payments and

eived,

“(2) the net amount of payments for tuition

and related expenses| described in  section

170(p)(2)(A) received with respect to the individual

during the calendar yea

Ir

“(3) a certification| that the institution meets

the requirements of sectjon 170(p)(2)(C), and

“(4) such other information as the Secretary

may prescribe.

“(b) STATEMENTS TO BE FURNISHED TO INDIVID-

UALS WITH RESPECT TO

QUIRED.—Every person req

VHOM INFORMATION IS RE-

qired to make a return under

subsection (a) shall furnish to each individual whose name

1s required to be set forth jn such return under subpara-

graph (a)(1) a written statement showing—

“(1) the name, a(ddress, and phone number of

“the information éonte‘iet of the person required to

make such return, and

“(2) the informption described in subsection

(a).

The written statement required under the preceding sen-

24 tence shall be furnished on or before January 31 of the



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

1 year following the calendar year for whi

74

the return

2 under subsection (a) was required to be made.”.

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENY.—The table of

sections for subpart B of part III of subchapter A

of chapter 61, as amended by
13518, is amended by adding/at the end the fol-

lowing new item:

“Scc. 6050Z. Returns relating to tuition for gpalified religious education.”.

(¢) EXEMPTION FROM SUBSTANTIATION REQUIRE-
MENT.—Section 170(f)(8)(A) is amended by adding at the
end the following: “The prec ing sentence shall not apply
to any amount treated as é haritable contribution by rea-
son of subsection (p).”

(d) EFFECTIVE DATH.—

(1) IN GENE
this section shall.

after December 3, 2018.

pply to taxable years beginning

(2) NO INFERENCE.—Nothing in the amend-
ments made by/this section shall create any infer-
ence regarding fthe tax treatment of any other pay-
ment for religigus education or training made before,

on, or after sugh date.

L.—The amendments made by



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

75

1 PART V—DEDUCTIONS AND EXCLUSIONS

2 SEC. 11041. SUSPENSION OF DEDUCTION FOR PERSONAL

3 EXEMPTIONS.

4 (a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (d) of section 151 is
5 amended—

6 (1) by striking “In the case of”’ in paragraph
7 (4) and inserting “Except as provided in paragraph

8 (5), in the case of”’, and

9 (2) by adding at the end the following new
10 paragraph:

11 “(5) SPECIAL RULES FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018
12 THROUGH 2025.—In the case of a taxable year begin-
13 ning after December 31, 2017, and before January
14 1, 2026—

15 “(A) EXEMPTION AMOUNT.—The term ‘ex-
16 emption amount’ means zero.

17 “(B) REFERENCES.—For purposes of any
18 other provision of this title, the reduction of the
19 exemption amount to zero under subparagraph
20 (A) shall not be taken into account in deter-
21 mining whether a deduction is allowed or allow-
22 able, or whether a taxpayer is entitled to a de-
23 duetion, under this section.”.
24 (b) APPLICATION TO ESTATES AND TRUSTS.—Sec-

25 tion 642(b)(2)(C) is amended by adding at the end the

26 following new clause:




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

76

1 “(i1) YEARS WHEN PERSONAL EX-

2 EMPTION AMOUNT IS ZERO.—

3 “(I) IN GENERAL.—In the case

4 of any taxable year in which the ex-

5 emption amount under section 151(d)

6 is zero, clause (i) shall be applied by

7 substituting ‘$4,150’ for ‘the exemp-

8 tion amount under section 151(d)’.

9 ‘(1) INFLATION ADJUST-
10 MENT.—In the case of any calendar
11 year beginning after 2018, the $4,150
12 amount in subparagraph (A) shall be
13 increased by an amount equal to—

14 “(aa) such dollar amount,
15 multiplied by

16 “(bb) the cost-of-living ad-
17 Justment determined under sec-
18 tion 1(f)(3) for the calendar year
19 in which the taxable year begins,
20 determined by  substituting
21 2017 for ‘2016’ in subpara-
22 graph (A)(i1) thereof.

23 If any increase determined under the
24 preceding sentence is not a multiple of




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 NN O B WD

[\ TR N TN NG TN NO TN N S N T S Sy SERG U S e S N e T e T )
N kW N = O O 00NN R W= O

7

$100, such increase shall be rounded

to the next lowest multiple of $100.”.

(¢) EXCEPTION FOR WAGE WITHHOLDING RULES.—
Scetion 3402(a) is amended by adding at the end the fol-

lowing new paragraph:

“(3) YEARS WHEN PERSONAL EXEMPTION

AMOUNT IS ZERO.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
taxable year in which the exemption amount
under section 151(d) 1s zero, paragraph (2)
shall be applied by substituting ‘$4,150° for ‘the
amount of one personal exemption provided in
section 151(b)’.

“(B) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In the
case of any calendar year beginning after 2018,
the $4,150 amount in subparagraph (A) shall
be inc¢reased by an amount equal to—

“(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(11) the cost-of-hving adjustment, de-
termined under section 1(f)(3) for the cal-
endar year in which the taxable year be-
gins, determined by substituting ‘2017’ for

‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(11) thereof.

If any increase determined under the preceding

sentence is not a multiple of $100, such in-



O\NOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

78

1 crease shall be rounded to the next lowest mul-
2 tiple of $100.”.

3 (d) EXCEPTION FOR DETERMINING PROPERTY EX-
4 EMmrT FroM LEVY.—Section 6334(d) is amended by add-
S ing at the end the following new paragraph:

6 “(4) YEARS WHEN PERSONAL EXEMPTION
7 AMOUNT IS ZERO.—

8 “(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
9 taxable year in which the exemption amount
10 under section 151(d) is zero, paragraph (2)
11 shall not apply and for purposes of paragraph
12 (1) the term ‘exempt amount’ means an amount
13 equal to—

14 “(1) the sum of the amount deter-
15 mined under subparagraph (B) and the
16 standard deduction, divided by

17 “(i1) 52.

18 “(B) AMOUNT DETERMINED.—For pur-
19 poses of subparagraph (A), the amount deter-
20 mined under this subparagraph is $4,150 multi-
21 plied by the number of the taxpayer’s depend-
22 ents for the taxable year in which the levy oc-
23 curs.
24 “(C) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In the
25 case of any taxable year beginning after 2018,




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 0 N N U A W =

[N I e T e T e T e T W o S = = S Y
O O 00 N N W bR W= O

21

79
the $4,150 amount in subparagraph (B) shall

be increased by an amount equal to—
“(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(11) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
termined under section 1(f)(3) for the cal-
endar year in which the taxable year be-
gins, determined by substituting ‘2017 for

‘2016’ in subparagraph (A)(i1) thereof.

If any increase determined under the preceding
sentence 1s not a multiple of $100, such in-
creasce shall be rounded to the next lowest mul-
tiple of $100.

“(D) VERIFIED STATEMENT.—Unless the
taxpayer submits to the Secretary a written and
properly verified statement specifying the facts
neeessary to  determine the proper amount
under subparagraph (A), subparagraph (A)
shall be applied as if the taxpayer were a mar-
ried individual filing a separate return with no

dependents.”.

(¢) PERSONS REQUIRED TO MAKE RETURNS OF IN-

22 COME.—Section 6012 is amended by adding at the end

23 the following new subsection:

24

“(f) SPECIAL RULE FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018

25 THROUGH 2025.—In the case of a taxable yeaf beginning



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 9 N AW =

N N N N N e mm e b e e e e e
AW = O 0 NN N R W=D

80
after Deeember 31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026,

subsection (a)(1) shall not apply, and every individual who
has gross income for the taxable year shall be required
to make returns with respect to income taxes under sub-
title A, except that a return shall not be required of—
“(1) an individual who i1s not married (deter-
mined by applying section 7703) and who has gross
income for the taxable year which does not exceed
the standard deduction applicable to such individual
for such taxable year under section 63, or
“(2) an individual entitled to make a joint re-
turn if—

“(A) the gross income of such individual,
when combined with the gross income of such
individual’s spouse, for the taxable year does
not exceed the standard deduction which would
be applicable to the taxpayer for such taxable
year under section 63 if such individual and
such individual’s spouse made a joint return,

“(B) such individual and such individual’s
spouse have the same houschold as their home
at the close of the taxable year,

“(C) such individual’s spouse does not

make a separate return, and




OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

81

1 “(D) neither such individual nor such indi-
2 vidual’s spouse is an individual described in sec-
3 tion 63(c)(5) who has income (other than
4 carned income) in excess of the amount in ef-
5 fect under section 63(c)(5)(A).”.

6 (f) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
7 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
8 December 31, 2017.

9 SEC. 11042. SUSPENSION OF DEDUCTION FOR STATE AND
10 LOCAL, ETC. TAXES.

11 (a) IN GENERAL.—Subscetion (b) of section 164 is
12 amended by adding at the end the following new para-
13 graph:

14 “(6) SUSPENSION OF INDIVIDUAL DEDUCTIONS
15 FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018 THROUGH 2025.—In the
16 case of an individual and a taxable ycar beginning
17 after December 31, 2017, and before January 1,
18 2026—

19 “(A) forcign real property taxes (other
20 than taxes which are paid or accrued in car-
21 rying on a trade or business or an activity de-
22 scribed in section 212) shall not be taken into
23 account under subsection (a)(1),
24 “(13) the aggregate amount of taxes (other
25 than taxes which are paid or accrued in car-




OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N &N W b~ WD -

N T N T N T N N 2 T e e S S S Sy S ey
A W D= O O NN N R WD = O

82

rying on a trade or business or an activity de-
scribed 1n section 212) taken into account
under subsection (a)(1) for any taxable year
shall not exceed $10,000 ($5,000 in the case of
a married individual filing a separate return),

“(C) subsection (a)(2) shall only apply to
taxes which are paid or accrued in carrying on
a trade or business or an activity deseribed in
section 212,

“(D) subsection (a)(3) shall not apply to
State and local taxes, and

“(E) paragraph (5) shall not apply.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11043. SUSPENSION OF DEDUCTION FOR HOME EQ-
UITY INTEREST.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 163(h)(3)(A)(ii) is
amended by mserting “in the case of taxable years begin-
ning before January 1, 2018, or after December 31,
2025, hefore “home equity indebtedness”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this section shall apply to taxable years ending after De-

cember 31, 2017.




O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.
83
SEC. 11044. MODIFICATION OF DEDUCTION FOR PERSONAL

1

O o0 N N U A~ W

N N NN N N N s o e ek e e em =
A U B W NN= O 0O NN N N RAW NN RO

CASUALTY LOSSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (h) of section 165 is
amended by adding at the end the following new para-
graph:

“(5) LIMITATION FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018
THROUGH 2025.—In the case of an individual, any
loss described in subsection (¢)(3) which (but for
this paragraph) would be deductible in a taxable
year beginning after December 31, 2017, and before
January 1, 2026, shall be allowed only to the extent
it 1s attributable to a Federally declared disaster (as
defined in subsection (1)(5)). The preceding sentence
shall not apply to any deduction under section 172
which is carried to such a taxable yecar from a tax-

able year beginning before January 1, 2018.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to losses incurred in taxable years
beginning after December 31, 2017.
SEC. 11045. SUSPENSION OF MISCELLANEOUS ITEMIZED
DEDUCTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 67 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:

“(g) SUSPENSION FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018

THROUGH 2025.—Notwithstanding subsection (a), no

miscellaneous itemized deduction shall be allowed for any



ONOTTNOTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C

O 0 N N AW e

[\ N N [\] N [a— — [ — p— oy o — — —
SN w 9] — (ew) O o0 ~3 o)) W BN w [\ — (e

84
taxable year beginning after December 31, 2017, and be-
fore January 1, 2026.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.
SEC. 11046. SUSPENSION OF OVERALL LIMITATION ON

ITEMIZED DEDUCTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Scction 68 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subseetion:

“(f) SECTION NOT TO APPLY.—This section shall not
apply to any taxable year beginéling after December 31,

2017, and before January 1, 20%.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11047. MODIFICATION OF EXCLUSION OF GAIN FROM
SALE OF PRINCIPAL RESIDENCE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 121 is amended by adding

at the end the following new subseetion:
“(h) SPECIAL RULES FOR SALES OR EXCIIANGES IN

TAXABLE YEARS 2018 TITROUGII 2025.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In applying this section

with respeet to sales or exchanges after December

31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026—



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN N B W

[ T NS N NG T N N N T S e T e S e S e N S S Sy
AW N = O O XN N RNV = O

85
“(A) ‘B-year’ shall be substituted for 5-

year’ each place 1t appears in subsections (a),

(b)(5)(C)(11)(I), and (e)(1)(B)(1)(I) and para-

graphs (7), (9), (10), and (12) of subsecction

(d),

“(B) ‘D years’ shall be substituted for ‘2

years’ each place it appears in subsections (a),

(b)(3), ()4,  (H(GNO))(),  and

(¢)(1)(B)(i1), and

“(C) ‘b-year’ shall be substituted for ‘2-

year’ in subsection (b)(3).

“(2) EXCEPTION FOR BINDING CONTRACTS.—
Paragraph (1) shall not apply to any sale or ex-
change with respeet to which there was a written
binding contract in effect before January 1, 2018,
and at all times thereafter before the sale or ex-

change.”.

(b) EFrECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to sales and exchanges after De-
cember 31, 2017.

SEC. 11048. SUSPENSION OF EXCLUSION FOR QUALIFIED

BICYCLE COMMUTING REIMBURSEMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 132(f) is amended by

adding at the end the following new paragraph:



OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

86
“(8) SUSPENSION OF QUALIFIED BICYCLE COM-
MUTING REIMBURSEMENT EXCLUSION.—Paragraph
(1)(D) shall not apply to any taxable year beginning
after December 31, 2017, and before January 1,
2026.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11049. SUSPENSION OF EXCLUSION FOR QUALIFIED

MOVING EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Scetion 132(g) is amended
(1) by striking “For purposes of this section,

the term” and inserting “For purposes of this sec-

tion—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The term”, and

(2) by adding at the end the following new
paragraph:

“(2) SUSPENSION FOR TAXABLE YEARS 2018
TIIROUGII 2025.—Except in the case of a member of
the Armed Forces of the United States on active
duty who moves pursuant to a military order and in-
cident to a permanent change of station, subsection
(a)(6) shall not apply to any taxable year beginning
after December 31, 2017, and before January 1,
2026.”.



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N U AW -

N N N N = = e e e e e e e e
W N = O O 00 NN N DW= O

87

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.

The amendments made by

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11050. SUSPENSION OF DEDUCTION FOR MOVING EX-
PENSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.

Seection 217 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:

“(k) SUSPENSION OF DEDUCTION FOR TAXABLE
Years 2018 Turouair 2025.—Exeept in the case of an
individual to whom subsection (g) applies, this section
shall not apply to any taxable year beginning after Decem-
ber 31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this scetion shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

SEC. 11051. LIMITATION ON WAGERING LOSSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 165(d) is amended by
adding at the end the following: “For purposes of the pre-
ceding sentence, in the case of taxable years beginning
after December 31, 2017, and before January 1, 2026,
the term ‘losses from wagering transactions’ includes any
deduction otherwise allowable under this chapter incurred

in carrying on any wagering transaction.”’.



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

88
1 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
2 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
3 December 31, 2017.
4  PART VI—INCREASE IN ESTATE AND GIFT TAX
5 EXEMPTION
6 SEC. 11061. INCREASE IN ESTATE AND GIFT TAX EXEMP-
7 TION.
8 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 2010(c)(3) is amended by
9 adding at the end the following new subparagraph:
10 “(C) INCREASE IN BASIC EXCLUSION
11 AMOUNT.—In the case of estates of decedents
12 dying or gifts made after December 31, 2017,
13 and before January 1, 2026, subparagraph (A)
14 shall be applied by substituting ‘610,000,000’
15 for ‘$5,000,000°.”.
16 (b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Subscction (g) of

17 section 2001 1s amended to read as follows:

18 “(g) MODIFICATIONS TO TAX PAYABLE.

19 ‘(1) MODIFICATIONS TO GIFT TAX PAYABLE 10
20 REFLECT DIFFERENT TAX RATES.—For purposes of
21 applying subsecection (b)(2) with respeet to 1 or more
22 gifts, the rates of tax under subsection (¢) in effect
23 at the decedent’s death shall, in lieu of the rates of
24 tax in effect at the time of such gifts, be used both

25 to compute—



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml ([file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN O B WD

[\ I O e e e e e e e
— O O o0 N N R~ W N = O

22

TO

AMOUNTS.

89
“(A) the tax imposed by chapter 12 with
respect to such gifts, and
“(B) the credit allowed against such tax
under section 2505, including in computing—
“(i) the applicable credit amount
under seetion 2505(a)(1), and
“(11) the sum of the amounts allowed
as a credit for all preceding periods under
section 2505(a)(2).
“(2) MODIFICATIONS TO ESTATE TAX PAYABLE
REFLECT DIFFEREXNT BASIC EXCLUSION

The Secretary shall prescribe such regu-

lations as may be necessary or appropriate to carry

out this section with respeet to any difference be-

tween—

“(A) the basie exelusion amount under sce-
tion 2010(¢)(3) applicable at the time of the de-
cedent’s death, and

“(I13) the basic cexclusion amount under
such section applicable with respect to any gifts

made by the deeedent.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

23 this section shall apply to estates of decedents dying and

24 gifts made after December 31, 2017.



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

90
PART VII—-TAXPAYER RIGHTS AND TAX

ADMINISTRATION
SEC. 11071. EXTENSION OF TIME LIMIT FOR CONTESTING
IRS LEVY.
(a) EXTENSIOXN OF TIME FOR RETURN OF PROPERTY
SUBJECT TO LEvVY.—Subsection (b) of section 6343 is
amended by striking “9 months” and inserting 2 years’.

(b) PERIOD OF LIMITATION ON SUITS.—Subsection

(¢) of section 6532 1s amended—
(1) by striking “9 months” in paragraph (1)
and inserting “2 years”, and
(2) by striking “9-month’ in paragraph (2) and
inserting ‘‘2-year”.
(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to—
(1) levies made after the date of the enactment
of this Aect, and
(2) levies made on or before such date if the 9-
month period has not expired under section 6343(b)
of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 (without re-
gard to this section) as of such date.
SEC. 11072. MODIFICATION OF USER FEE REQUIREMENTS
FOR INSTALLMENT AGREEMENTS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 6159 is amended by re-
designating subsection (f) as subsection (g) and by insert-

ing after subsection (e) the following new subsection:



ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5]

O 00 N N B kWD -

N N N N M e e e ek e e e e e
W N = O O 00 NN N R W N = O

24

w
=
@]

91

“(f) INSTALLMENT AGREEMENT FEES.—

“(1) LIMITATION ON FEE AMOUNT.—The

amount of any fee imposed on an installment agree-
ment under this section may not exceed the amount
of such fee as in effect on the date of the enactment

of this subscction.

“(2) WAIVER OR REIMBURSEMENT.—In the

case of any taxpayer with an adjusted gross income,
as determined for the most recent year for which
such information is available, which does not exceed
250 pereent of the applicable poverty level (as deter-

mined by the Secretary)—

“(A) 1if the taxpayer has agreed to make
payments under the installment agreement by
electronic payment through a debit instrument,
no fee shall be imposed on an installment agree-
ment under this section, and

“(B) if the taxpayer is unable to make
payments under the installment agreement by
electronic payment through a debit instrument,
the Seeretary shall, upon completion of the in-
stallment agreement, pay the taxpayer an

amount equal to any such fees imposed.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

25 this section shall apply to agreements entered into on or



OANOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 NN N i AW

NN N N N N = o e e e e m e e
N A~ W NN = O 0 0NN A WD = O

92
after the date which 1s 60 days after the date of the enact-
ment of this Act.
SEC. 11073. ATTORNEYS’ FEES RELATING TO AWARDS TO
WHISTLEBLOWERS.
(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (21) of section 62(a)
is amended to read as follows:
“(21) ATTORNEYS’ FEES RELATING TO AWARDS

TO WHISTLEBLOWERS.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Any deduction allow-
able under this chapter for attorney fees and
court costs paid by, or on bchalf of, the tax-
payer in connection with any award under—
“(1) section 7623(b), or
‘(1) any action brought under—

“(I) seetion 21F of the Securities
Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C.
78u-6),

“(IT) a State false claims act, in-
cluding a State false claims act with
qui tam provisions, or

“(III) scetion 23 of the Com-
modity Exchange Act (7 U.S.C. 26).

“(B) MAY NOT EXCEED AWARD.—Sub-

paragraph (A) shall not apply to any deduction

m excess of the amount includible in the tax-



OAOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.
93

1 payer’s gross income for the taxable year on ac-
count of such award.”.
(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this scection shall apply to taxable yecars beginning after

December 31, 2017.
SEC. 11074. CLARIFICATION OF WHISTLEBLOWER AWARDS.
(a) DEFINITION OF PROCEEDS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 7623 is amended by

O© o0 N O W b W

adding at the end the following new subsection:
10 “(¢) PROCEEDS.—For purposes of this section, the

11 term ‘proceeds’ includes—

12 “(1) penalties, interest, additions to tax, and
13 additional amounts provided under the internal rev-
14 cnue laws, and

15 “(2) any proceeds arising from laws for which
16 the Internal Revenue Service is authorized to admin-
17 ister, enforce, or investigate, including—

18 “(A) criminal fines and civil forfeitures,
19 and

20 “(B) wviolations of reporting require-
21 ments.”’.

22 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—Paragraphs
23 (1) and (2)(A) of section 7623(b) are each amended
24 by striking “collected proceeds (including penalties,

25 interest, additions to tax, and additional amounts)




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

o 0 N N W b W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

94

resulting from the action” and inserting “proceeds

collected as a result of the action”.

(b) AMOUNT OF PROCEEDS DETERMINED WITHOUT
REGARD TO AVAILABILITY.—Paragraphs (1) and (2)(A)
of section 7623(b) are each amended by inserting ““(deter-
mined without regard to whether such proceeds are avail-
able to the Secretary)” after “in response to such action”.

(¢) DISPUTED AMOUNT THRESHOLD.—Section
7623(b)(5)(B) 1s amended by striking “tax, penalties, in-
terest, additions to tax, and additional amounts’ and in-
serting “‘procceds’’.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to information provided before, on,
or after the date of the enactment of this Aet with respect
to which a final determination for an award has not been
made before such date of enactiment.

PART VIII—INDIVIDUAL MANDATE
SEC. 11081. ELIMINATION OF SHARED RESPONSIBILITY
PAYMENT FOR INDIVIDUALS FAILING TO
MAINTAIN MINIMUM ESSENTIAL COVERAGE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Scction 5000A(c) i1s amended

(1) in paragraph (2)(B)(ii), by striking “2.5
percent” and inserting ‘“‘Zero percent”’, and

(2) in paragraph (3)—



O\OTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C

O 00 N O Wwn b~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

95
(A) by striking “$695” in subparagraph
(A) and inserting “$0”, and
(B) by striking subparagraph (D).

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to months beginning after Decem-
ber 31, 2018.

Subtitle B—Alternative Minimum
Tax
SEC. 12001. INCREASED EXEMPTION FOR INDIVIDUALS.

(a) INCREASED EXEMPTION.—Section 55(d) is
amended by adding at the end the following new para-
graph:

“(5) SPECIAL RULE FOR TAXABLE YEARS BE-

GINNING AFTER 2017 AND BEFORE 2026.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
taxable year beginning after December 31,
2017, and before January 1, 2026—

“(1) paragraph (1) shall be applied—
“(I) by substituting ‘$109,400’
for ‘478,750’ in subparagraph (A),
and
“(II) by substituting ‘$70,300°
for ‘650,600’ in subparagraph (B),

and

“(i1) paragraph (3) shall be applied—




ONOTT\OTT17834.xml [file 2 of 5] S.L.C.

96

1 “(I) by substituting ‘$208,400’
2 for ‘$150,000’ in subparagraph (A),

3 “(IT) by substituting ‘$156,300’
4 for ‘$112,500’ in subparagraph (I3),
5 and

6 “(II) in the ecase of a taxpayer
7 described in paragraph (1)(D), with-
8 out regard to the substitution under
9 subclause (I).

10 “(B) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—

11 “(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any
12 taxable year beginning in a calendar year
13 after 2018, the amounts described in
14 clause (i1) shall cach be increased by an
15 amount equal to—

16 “(I) such dollar amount, multi-
17 plied by

18 “(II) the cost-of-living adjust-
19 ment determined under section 1(f)(3)
20 for the calendar year in which the tax-
21 able year begins, determined by sub-
22 stituting ‘calendar year 2017 for ‘cal-
23 endar year 2016’ in subparagraph
24 (A)(11) thereof.




OAMCEHMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N i bR W e

N NN N N e e e e e e e e
WD = O O 0NN N DR WD =D

97

“(11)  AMOUXNTS DESCRIBED.—The
amounts described in this clause are the
$109,400 amount in  subparagraph
(A)(i)(I), the $70,300 amount in subpara-
graph (A)(i)(II), the $208,400 amount in
subparagraph (A)(i1)(I), and the $156,300
amount in subparagraph (A)(ii)(II).

“(iii)  ROUNDING.—Any increased
amount determined under clause (1) shall
be rounded to the nearest multiple of
$100.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017.

Subtitle C—Business-related

Provisions

PART I—CORPORATE PROVISIONS
SEC. 13001. 20-PERCENT CORPORATE TAX RATE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subscction (b) of section 11 is
amended to read as follows:

“(b) AMOUNT OF TAX.—The amount of the tax imn-
posed by subsection (a) shall be 20 percent of taxable in-

come.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—




OAMCG\MCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O 00 N N U A WD =

[\ T N T N T N T N S N S Y ey
A W N = O O 0NN NN R WDy = O

98

(1) The following sections are cach amended by
striking “‘section 11(b)(1)” and inserting “‘section
11(b)”:

(A) Section 280C(¢)(3)(13) (i) (IT).
(B) Paragraphs (2)(B) and (6)(A)(i1) of

section 860K (e).

(C) Section 7874(e)(1)(B).

(2)(A) Part I of subchapter P of chapter 1 is
amended by striking section 1201 (and by striking
the item relating to such section in the table of sec-
tions for such part).

(B) Section 12 is amended by striking para-
graphs (4) and (6), and by redesignating paragraph
(5) as paragraph (4).

(C) Section 453A(c)(3) is amended by striking
“or 1V201 (whichever is appropriate)’”.

(D) Section 527(b) is amended—

(1) by striking paragraph (2), and
(i1) by striking all that precedes ‘“‘is hereby
imposed” and inserting:
“(b) TAX IMPOSED.—A tax”’.
(E) Sections 594(a) is amended by striking

“taxes imposed by section 11 or 1201(a)” and in-

serting “‘tax imposed by section 117,




O:\MCG\MCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N A W

NN N N N e e e e e R e e e
£ W D =, O O NN N N WND = O

99

(F) Scction 691(e)(4) i1s amended by striking
“1201,”.

(G) Section 801(a) 1s amended—

(i) by striking paragraph (2), and

(i1) by striking all that precedes ‘““is hereby
imposed”’ and inserting:

“(a) TAX IMPOSED.—A tax”’.

(H) Section 831(e) is amended by striking
paragraph (1) and by redesignating paragraphs (2)
and (3) as paragraphs (1) and (2), respectively.

(I) Seetions 832(¢)(5) and 834(h)(1)(D) are
each amended by striking ‘“‘sec. 1201 and fol-
lowing,”.

(J) Section 852(b)(3)(A) is amended by strik-
ing “section 1201(a)” and inserting ‘“‘section 11(b)”.

(K) Seetion 857(h)(3) 1s amended—

(1) by striking subparagraph (A) and re-
designating subparagraphs (B) through (F) as
subparagraphs (A) through (E), respectively,

(1) in subparagraph (C), as so redesig-
nated—

(I) by striking ‘“subparagraph (A)(ii)”

in clause (i) thereof and inserting “‘para-

graph (1)”,




O\MCEMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

100

1 (IT) by striking “the tax imposed by
2 subparagraph (A)(i1))” in clauses (i1) and
3 (iv) thereof and inserting ‘‘the tax imposed
4 by paragraph (1) on undistributed capital
5 gain”’,

6 (ii1) in subparagraph (E), as so redesig-
7 nated, by striking “sﬁbparagraph (B) or (D)”
8 and inserting ‘‘subparagraph (A) or (C)”, and
9 (iv) by adding at the end the following new
10 subparagraph:

11 “(F) UNDISTRIBUTED CAPITAL GAIN.—
12 For purposes of this paragraph, the term ‘un-
13 distributed capital gain’ means the excess of the
14 net capital gain over the deduction for divi-
15 dends paid (as defined in section 561) deter-
16 mined with reference to capital gain dividends
17 only.”.

18 (L) Section 882(a)(1) is amended by striking ,
19 55, or 1201(a)” and inserting “‘or 557,
20 (M) Section 904(b) 1s amended—
21 (1) by striking “or 1201(a)” in paragraph
22 (2)(O),
23 (1) by striking paragraph (3)(D) and in-

24 serting the following:




O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

101

1 ‘D) CAPITAL GAIN RATE DIFFEREN-
2 TIAL.—There is a capital gain rate differential
3 for any year if subsection (h) of section 1 ap-
4 plics to such taxable year.”, and

5 (iii) by striking paragraph (3)(E) and in-
6 serting the following:

7 “(E) RATE DIFFERENTIAL PORTION.—The
8 rate differential portion of foreign source net
9 capital gain, net capital gain, or the excess of
10 net capital gain from sources within the United
11 States over net capital gain, as the case may
12 be, is the same proportion of such amount as—
13 “(1) the excess of—

14 “(I) the highest rate of tax set
15 forth in subsection (a), (b), (¢), (d), or
16 (e) of section 1 (whichever applics),
17 over

18 “(IT) the alternative rate of tax
19 determined under section 1(h), bears
20 to

21 “(1) that rate referred to in subclause
22 (I).”.
23 (N) Section 1374(b) i1s amended by striking
24 paragraph (4).




O:\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N U B W e

[ N O T N e O N T Y S S o e GG G
A~ W N = O vV XN NN R, W=D

102

(O) Seection 1381(b) is amended by striking
“taxes imposed by section 11 or 1201”7 and inserting
“tax imposed by section 117,

() Scctions 6425(¢)(1)(A) and
6655(2)(1)(A)(i1) are each amended by striking ‘“‘or
1201(a),”.

(Q) Section 7518(g)(6)(A) is amended by strik-
ing “or 1201(a)”.

(3)(A) Section 1445(e)(1) is amended—

(1) by striking “35 percent” and inserting

“the highest rate of tax in effect for the taxable

year under section 11(b)”, and

(11) by striking “of the gain’” and inserting

“multiplied by the gain”.

(B) Section 1445(e)(2) is amended by striking
“35 percent of the amount” and inserting “the high-
est rate of tax in effect for the taxable year under
section 11(b) multiplied by the amount”.

(C) Section 1445(e)(6) is amended—

(1) by striking “35 percent” and inserting

“the highest rate of tax in effeet for the taxable

year under section 11(b)”’, and

(i1) by striking “of the amount” and in-

serting “‘multiplied by the amount”.




O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

e o0 3 N b W

N NN N e e e e e e e e e
W N = O O 00 NN B W N = O

103

(D) Seetion 1446(b)(2)(B) 1s amended by strik-
ing ‘“section 11(b)(1)” and inserting ‘‘section
11(b)”.

(4) Scetion 852(b)(1) i1s amended by striking
the last sentence.

(5)(A) Part I of subchapter B of chapter 5 is
amended by striking section 1551 (and by striking
the item relating to such section in the table of sec-
tions for such part).

(B) Section 535(c)(5) i1s amended to read as
follows:

“(5) CROSS REFERENCE.—For limitation on
credit provided in paragraph (2) or (3) in the case
of c¢ertain  controlled corporations, sce section
1561.”.

(6)(A) Scetion 1561(a) 18 amended—

(i) by striking paragraph (1) and redesig-
nating paragraphs (2) and (3) as paragraphs

(1) and (2), respectively,

(11) by striking ‘“amounts specified in para-
graph (1) and the amount speeified in para-

graph (3)” and inserting “the amount specified

in paragraph (2)”,




OAMCGMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

O 00 9 N AW

[\ I (N R O e O T N e T o T o S v L S VI o O GG WY
A W NN = O O g N N R W=D

104
(ii1) by striking “The amounts speeified in
paragraph (2)” and inserting “The amounts

specified in paragraph (1),

(iv) by striking the third sentence in the
flush language, and
(v) by striking “under paragraph (3)” and

inserting ‘“‘under paragraph (2)”.

(B) The first sentence of section 1561(b) is
amended to read as follows: “If a corporation has a
short taxable year which does not include a Decem-
ber 31 and is a component member of a controlled
group of corporations with respect to such taxable
year, then for purposes of this subtitle the amount
to be used in computing the accumulated earnings
credit under section 535(¢)(2) and (3) of such cor-
poration for such taxable year shall be the amount
specified in subsection (a)(1) divided by the number
of corporations which are component members of
such group on the last day of such taxable year.”

(7) Section 7518(g)(6)(A) is amended—

(A) by striking “With respect to the por-
tion” and inserting “In the case of a taxpayer

other than a corporation, with respect to the

portion”, and




O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O o0 N N W AW e

N N NN N e e e e e e pd e
A WD = O O 00NN R WNND = O

105
(B) by striking “(34 pereent in the ease of

a corporation)”’.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as otherwise pro-
vided in this subsection, the amendments made by
this scetion shall apply to taxable years beginning
after December 31, 2018.

(2) WITHHOLDING.—The amendments made by
subsection (b)(3) shall apply to distributions made
after December 31, 2018.

(3) CERTAIN TRANSFERS.—The amendments
made by subsection (b)(6) shall apply to transfers
made after December 31, 2018.

(d) NORMALIZATION REQUIREMENTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—A normalization method of
accounting shall not be treated as being used with
respect to any public utility property for purposes of
section 167 or 168 of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 if the taxpayer, in computing its cost of service
for ratemaking purposes and reflecting operating re-
sults in its regulated books of account, reduces the
excess tax reserve more rapidly or to a greater ex-

tent than such reserve would be reduced under the

average rate assumption method.




O:\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O© 00 9 O W A WD -

—_
o

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

106

(2) ALTERNATIVE METHOD FOR CERTAIN TAX-
PAYERS.—If, as of the first day of the taxable year
that includes the date of enactment of this Act—

(A) the taxpayer was required by a regu-
latory agency to compute depreciation for public
utility property on the basis of an average life
or composite rate method, and

(B) the taxpayer’s books and underlying
records did not contain the vintage account
data necessary to apply the average rate as-
sumption method,

the taxpayer will be treated as using a normalization
method of accounting if, with respect to such juris-
diction, the taxpayer uses the alternative method for
public utility property that is subject to the regu-
latory authority of that jurisdietion.

(3) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this sub-
section—

(A) EXCESS TAX RESERVE.—The term

“excess tax reserve’” means the excess of—

(1) the reserve for deferred taxes (as
described in section 168(1)(9)(A)(11) of the

Internal Revenue Code of 1986) as deter-

mined under the Internal Revenue Code of



O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

O 00 N AN W b~ W N e

NN N N N N = e e e e
DN A W N = O VOV 0 N O U A WN = O

107
1986 as in cffeet on the day before the

date of the enactment of this Act, over

(1) the amount which would be the
balance in such reserve if the amount of
such reserve were determined by assuming
that the corporate rate reductions provided
in this Act were in effect for all prior peri-
ods.

(B) AVERAGE RATE ASSUMPTION METII-
oD.—The average rate assumption method is
the method under which the excess in the re-
serve for deferred taxes is reduced over the re-
maining lives of the property as used in its reg-
ulated books of account which gave rise to the
reserve for deferred taxes. Under such method,
if timing differences for the property reverse,
the amount of the adjustment to the reserve for
the deferred taxes 1is calculated by multi-
plying—

(1) the ratio of the aggregate deferred
taxes for the property to the aggregate
timing differences for the property as of
the beginning of the period in question, by

(i) the amount of the timing dif-

ferences which reverse during such period.




w
-
@}

OAMCG\MCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5]

108
1 (C) ALTERNATIVE METHOD.—The ‘“alter-
2 native method” is the method in which the tax-
3 payer—
4 (i) computes the excess tax reserve on
5 all public utility property included in the
6 plant aceount on the basis of the weighted
7 average life or composite rate used to com-
8 pute depreciation for regulatory purposes,
9 and
10 (11) reduces the excess tax reserve rat-
11 ably over the remaining regulatory life of
12 the property.
13 (4) TAX INCREASED FOR NORMALIZATION VIO-
14 LATION.—If, for any taxable year ending after the
15 date of the enactment of this Act, the taxpayer does
16 not use a normalization method of accounting, the
17 taxpayer’s tax for the taxable year shall be increased
18 by the amount by which it reduces its excess tax re-
19 serve more rapidly than permitted under a normal-
20 1zation method of accounting.
21 SEC. 13002. REDUCTION IN DIVIDEND RECEIVED DEDUC-
22 TIONS TO REFLECT LOWER CORPORATE IN-
23 COME TAX RATES.
24 (a) DIVIDENDS RECEIVED BY CORPORATIONS.—




OA\MCG\WMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

109
1 (1) IN GENERAL.—Secction 243(a)(1) is amend-
2 ed by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50 per-
3 cent’’.
4 (2) DIVIDENDS FROM 20-PERCENT OWNED COR-
5 PORATIONS.—Section 243(c)(1) is amended—
6 (A) by striking “80 pereent” and inserting
7 “65 percent”, and
8 (B) by striking “70 percent” and inserting
9 “50 perceent”’.
10 (3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—The heading
11 for scction 243(c) is amended by striking “RETEN-
12 TION OF 80-PERCENT DIVIDEND RECEIVED DEDUC-
13 TION”" and inserting ‘“‘INCREASED PERCENTAGE”.
14 (b) DivibeNDS REcCEIVED From FSC.—Section
15 245(¢)(1)(B) is amended—
16 (1) by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50
17 percent”’ | and
18 (2) by striking “80 percent” and inserting “65
19 percent’’.
20 (¢) LIMITATION ON AGGREGATE AMOUNT OF DEDUC-
21 TIONS.—Scction 246(bh)(3) is amended—
22 (1) by striking “80 percent” in subparagraph
23 (A) and inserting “65 pereent”’, and
24 (2) by striking “70 percent” in subparagraph

25 (B) and inserting “50 percent”.




O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

110

(d) REDpUCTION IN DEDUCTION WHERE PORTFOLIO
STOCK IS DEBT-FINANCED.—Section 246A(a)(1) 1s
amended—

(1) by striking “70 percent” and inserting “50
percent’”’, and

(2) by striking “80 pereent” and inserting “65
percent’”’.

(¢) INCOME FrROM SOURCES WITHIN THE UNITED

STATES.—Secction 861(a)(2) 1s amended—
(1) by striking “100/70th” and inserting “100/
50th”” in subparagraph (B), and
(2) 1n the flush sentence at the end—
(A) by striking “100/80th” and inserting
“100/65th”, and
(B) by striking “100/70th” and inserting
“100/50th”.

(f) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2018.

PART II—SMALL BUSINESS REFORMS
SEC. 13101. MODIFICATIONS OF RULES FOR EXPENSING DE-

PRECIABLE BUSINESS ASSETS.

(a) INCREASE IN LIMITATION.—



O\MCGAMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

O 00 I N N B~ WON

[ I N O R e N S N T e e T e S
H~ W NN = O O 0NN AW NN -, O

111

(1) DOLLAR LIMITATION.—Section 179(b)(1) is
amended by striking “$500,000” and inserting
“$1,000,000”.

(2) REDUCTION IN  LIMITATION.—Scction

179(b)(2) 1s amended by striking “$2,000,000” and
mserting “$2,500,000”.
(3) INFLATION ADJUSTMENTS.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (A) of
section  179(b)(6), as amended by section
11002(d), is amended—

(1) by striking “2015” and inserting

“2018”, and

(i1) in clause (i1), by striking “cal-
endar year 2014” and inserting “calendar

year 2017,

(B) SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES.—Scction

179(b)(6) 1s amended—

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“paragraphs (1) and (2)” and inscrting
“paragraphs (1), (2), and (5)(A)”, and

(i1) in subparagraph (B), by inserting
“($100 in the case of any increase in the
amount under paragraph (5)(A))” after

“$10,000".



2
=
@]

OAMCG\WMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3]

112

1 (b) SECTION 179 PROPERTY TO INCLUDE QUALIFIED
2 REAL PROPERTY.—

3 (1) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (B) of section
4 179(d)(1) 1s amended to read as follows:

5 “(B) which 1s—

6 “(1) section 1245 property (as defined
7 in section 1245(a)(3)), or

8 “(ii) at the election of the taxpayer,
9 qualified real property (as defined in sub-
10 section (f)), and”.
11 (2) QUALIFIED REAL PROPERTY DEFINED.—
12 Subsection (f) of section 179 is amended to read as
13 follows:

14 “(f) QUALIFIED REAL PROPERTY.—For purposes of

15 this section, the term ‘qualified real property’ means—

16 “(1) any qualified improvement property de-
17 scribed 1n section 168(e)(6), and

18 “(2) any of the following improvements to non-
19 residential real property placed in service after the
20 date such property was first placed in service:

21 “(A) Roofs.

22 “(B) Heating, ventilation, and air-condi-
23 tioning property.

24 “(C) Fire protection and alarm systems.

25 “(D) Security systems.”.




O:\MCG\WMCG17C62.xml {file 3 of 3] S.L.C.

C 00 N N B~ WND -

RN NN N N N o = e e e e ek e e e
Whn A W NN = O O 0 NN R, W= O

113

(¢c) REPEAL OF EXCLUSION FOR CERTAIN PROP-
ERTY.—The last sentence of section 179(d)(1) 18 amended
by inserting ‘“‘(other than paragraph (2) thereof)” after
“section 50(b)”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to property placed in serviee in
taxable years beginning after December 31, 2017.

SEC. 13102. MODIFICATIONS OF GROSS RECEIPTS TEST FOR
USE OF CASH METHOD OF ACCOUNTING BY
CORPORATIONS AND PARTNERSHIPS.

(a) MODIFICATIONS OF GROSS RECEIPTS TEST.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—So much of section 448(¢)
as precedes paragraph (2) is amended to read as fol-
lows:

“(¢) GROSS RECEIPTS TEST.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A corporation or partner-
ship meets the gross receipts test of this subsection
for any taxable year if the average annual gross re-
ceipts of such entity for the 3-taxable-year period
ending with the taxable year which precedes such
taxable year does not exeeed the applicable dollar
limit.”.

(2) APPLICABLE DOLLAR LIMIT.—Subsection
(¢) of section 448 1s amended by adding at the end

the following new paragraph:



OAMCG\MCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 3] S.L.C.
114

“(4) APPLICABLE DOLLAR LIMIT.—

O oo N O W A WD

[\ I N I T e e T e T S o S~ S = S =Y
—_— O O 0 N N W WY = O

22
23
24
25

Paragraph (7) of section 448(d) is amended

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The applicable dollar
limit is $15,000,000.

“(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In
the case of any taxable year beginning after De-
cember 31, 2018, the $15,000,000 amount
under subparagraph (A) shall be increased by
an amount equal to—

“(1) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(i1) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
termined under seetion 1(f)(3) for the cal-
endar year in which the taxable year be-

gins, by substituting ‘calendar year 2017’

for ‘calendar year 2016’ in subparagraph

(A)(11) thereof.

If any amount as inereased under the preeeding
sentence is not a multiple of $1,000, such
amount shall be rounded to the next lowest
multiple of $1,000.”.

(3) CHANGE IN METHOD OF ACCOUNTING.—

(A) by striking “In the case of” and all
that follows up to subparagraph (A) and insert-
ing: “If a taxpayer changes its method of ac-

counting because the taxpayer 1s prohibited



O\MCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

115

1 from using the cash receipts and disbursement
2 method of accounting by reason of subsection
3 (a) or is no longer prohibited from using such
4 method by reason of such subsection—"", and

5 (B) by inserting “and” at the end of sub-
6 paragraph (A), by striking “, and” at the end
7 of subparagraph (B) and inserting a period,
8 and by striking subparagraph (C).

9 (4) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Paragraph (3)
10 of section 448(b) 1s amended to read as follows:

11 “(3) ENTITIES SATISFYING GROSS RECEIPTS
12 TEST.—Paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (a)
13 shall not apply to any corporation or partnership for
14 any taxable year if such entity meets the gross re-
15 ceipts test of subsection (¢) for the taxable year.”.
16 (b) APPLICATION OF MODIFICATIONS TO KFARMING
17 CORPORATIONS.—

18 (1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section
19 447(d) 1s amended to read as follows:
20 “(1) IN GENERAL.—A corporation meets the re-
21 quircments of this subseetion for any taxable year
22 with respect to its gross receipts if the corporation
23 meets the gross receipts test of section 448(c) for
24 the taxable ycar.”.



OAMCGWMCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5] S.L.C.

O 0 NN AN W B WD

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

116

(2) FAMILY CORPORATIONS.—Paragraph (2) of

section 447(d) 1s amended—

(A) by striking subparagraph (A) and in-
serting the following:

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a fam-
ily corporation, in applying section 448(e) for
purposes of paragraph (1)—

“(1) paragraph (1) of section 448(c)
shall be applied by substituting the appli-
cable family corporation limit for the appli-
cable dollar limit, and

‘(1) the rules of subparagraph (B)
shall apply in computing gross receipts.”,
(B) in subparagraph (B)(i), by striking

“the last sentence of paragraph (1) and insert-
ing ‘“‘paragraph (2) of scetion 448(c)”’, and

(C) by adding at the end the following new
subparagraph:

“(D) APPLICABLE FAMILY CORPORATION
LIMIT.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The applicable
family corporation limit is $25,000,000.

“(11) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—
In the case of any taxable year beginning

after December 31, 2018, the $25,000,000



OAMCG\MCG17C62.xml [file 3 of 5]

O 0 NN N B WD

N N N NN N = m e e e a
Wn A W DN = © VWV 0o NN O W & W D = ©

w
&
«

117

amount under clause (i) shall be inercased
by an amount equal to—
“(I) such dollar amount, multi-
plied by
“(IT) the cost-of-living adjust-
ment determined under section 1(f)(3)
for the calendar year in which the tax-
able year begins, by substituting ‘cal-
endar year 2017 for ‘calendar year
2016’ in subparagraph (A)(ii) thereof.
If any amount as inercased under the pre-
ceding sentence is not a multiple of
$1,000, such amount shall be rounded to
the next lowest multiple of $1,000.”.
(3) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN CORPORA-
TIONS.—Subscetion (¢) of scetion 447 is amended by
inserting “for any taxable year” after “not being a

corporation’’.

(4) CIIANGE IN METIIOD OF ACCOUNTING.
Section 447(f) is amended—

(A) by striking “In the case of” and all
tha